Lee County Board Of County Commissioners
Agenda Item Summary Blue Sheet No. 20030304

1. REQUESTED MOTION:

ACTION REQUESTED: Approve the award of the following Projects: # EX030389, the purchase of one (1) International cab and
chassis truck from International Truck and Engine Corporation at the Florida State Contract price (including several non-contract options)
of $53,009.00; and # IT030390, the purchase and installation of a dump body at the informally quoted price of $10,130.12 from the best
price vendor Jim lardee Equipment Company, Inc.; for Lee County Parks and Recreation. Grand total for this purchase: $63,139.12.

WHY ACTION IS NECESSARY: Section 11.0.3.1 of the Lee County Purchasing and Payment Procedures Manual exempts “the
purchase of equipment that has gone through the Administrative Code Procedure, such as State Contracts or Federal General Services
Administration Schedules, providing the purchase, rental, or lease amount does not exceed $50,000.00”. As this expenditure will exceed
$50,000.00, Board approval is required.

WHAT ACTION ACCOMPLISHES: Provides Lee County Parks and Recreation with the equipment necessary to keep up with
ever increasing ball field maintenance and construction; as well as any additional special projects that Parks may undertake in the future.
This truck replaces asset #019564 which has met Fleet Management’s replacement criteria.
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--BACKGROUND CONTINUED FROM PAGE ONE--

On March 11, 2003, the Division of Purchasing received a request from the Parks and Recreation Department and the Division
of Fleet Management to purchase one (1) new International cab and chassis truck at the prices listed in the Florida State
Contract #070-700-02-1; and one (1) dump body from Jim Hardee Equipment Company, Inc.

Section 11.0.3.1 of the Lee County Purchasing and Payment Procedures Manual exempts “the purchase of equipment that has
gone through the Administrative Code Procedure, such as State Contracts or Federal General Services Administration
Schedules, providing the purchase, rental, or lease amount does not exceed $50,000.00”. As this expenditure will exceed
$50,000.00, Board approval is required.

Therefore, Board approval is requested to purchase one (1) new International cab and chassis truck from International Truck
and Engine Corporation, at the Florida State Contract base price with contract and non-contract options of $53,009.00; and the
purchase and instailation of one (1) dump body from Jim Hardee Equipment Company, Inc. at a competitively quoted price of
$10,130.12. Grand total for one (1) complete truck, which is for use by Parks and Recreation, is $63,139.12.

Funds are available: KH5722015500.506430

Attachments:

(1) Department Request for Purchase

(2) Florida State Contract #070-700-02-1/International Truck and Engine Corporation Quotation
3) Tabulation Sheet and Quotes for IT030390

@ Repair History/Replacement Justification for Unit #019564



ATTACHMENT~ L

DIVISION OF
LEE COUNTY FLEET MANAGEMENT
%
<,
To:  Janet Sheehan, Purchasing Director %
From: Marilyn Rawlings, Fleet Manager /:’
) <
Date: 3/7/2003 &/
Re: Blue Sheet for the purchase (1) one Intemational 5600 GVWR Dump Truck c%.

Please prepare a Blue Sheet for the purchase of one (1) Intemational 5600 GVWR Cab and Chassis’
from International Truck and Engine Corporation.

ACTION REQUESTED:

Approve the Florida State Contract purchase of (1) Intemational 5600 GVWVR cab and chassis' from
International Truck and Engine Corporation in the amount of $53,009.00. Approve the purchase on
non-contract items from Intemnational Truck and Engine Corporation in the amount of $2,713.00.
Approve the purchase of the dump body from Jim Hardee Equipment company, Inc in the amount of
$10,130.12, for a total purchase price of $63,139.12.

WHY ACTION IS NECESSARY:

Section 11.0.3.1 of the Lee County Purchasing and Payment Procedures Manual exempts “the
purchase of equipment that has gene through the Administrative Code Procedure, such as State
Contracts or Federal General Services Administration Schedules, providing the purchase, rental, or
lease amount does not exceed $50,000.00." As this expenditure will exceed $50,000.00, Board
approval is necessary.

WHAT ACTION ACCOMPLISHES:

This purchase allows Lee County Fleet Management to pursue the policy of standardization of
purchasing Intemnational trucks. This allows Lee County Fleet Management to have a uniform
inventory of the same type trucks, enabling us to stock the same type parts.

BACKGROUND:

Lee County Fleet Management received a request from Parks and Recreation to purchase (1)
Intemational dump truck, replacing 019564, This is a replacement purchase te their Fleet. This
machinery is necessary to assist with the ever-increasing ball field maintenance and construction and
any additional special projects that the depariment needs to undertake. Funds to purchase this
equipment will be charged to account string KH5722015500.506430.

Cc: Donat Lawes
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LEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT, DIVISION OF FLEET MANAGEMENT

EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLE REQUEST FORM
(PLEASE PRINT OR TYPE)

1. DEPARTMENT/DIVISION: (name)

3. ISTHIS A REPLACEMENT EQUIPMENT OR VEHICLE ? [ ] YES
If yes: Asset #: |q S-'(—"L‘ Yr: ?&' Make: Tu"-

(number)

2. REQUESTED BY: (print) e e R toe~

kd

Maodel: U('TOO

PHONE # 229~ 7357

[ INO

4. WHAT TYPE OF EQUIPMENT OR VEHICLE ARE YOU REQUESTING?

Select all appropriate boxes:

Meter: m

[ ]Sedan [ ]Mid-Size [ 1% Ton [ 12Door { ]Cargo [ ]Gasoline

[ ]Station Wagon [ ] Full-Size i 1%2Ton [ 13Door L-Side [ |7 Passenger [ ]Diesel

[ 1SportUtil Veh [ ]Regular Cab [ 1% Ton [ 13DoorR-Side [ ]12 Passenger { 14 Cylinder
[ 1Pickup Truck [ ] Extended Cab [ 11Ton { 14Doot [ ]115Passenger [ ]6 Cylinder
[ ]1Cab & Chassis [ ] Crew Cab { 1Class6 [ 1UtilityBody® [ ]SlidingDoor [ ]8 Cylinder
[ ]Van [ ]2WheelDrive [ JClass?7 [ ]FlatBed* [ 1Swing Door [ ]10Cylinder
[ ]Other [ ]4 WheelDrive® [ ]Class 8 [3q Dump Truck # [ }Single RW [ 1DualRW

Additional description for vehicles or equipment:

#Please provide detailed justification on separate sheet.

5. WHAT, IF ANY, SPECIAL OPTIONS OR ACCESSORIES ARE REQUIRED? Piease check all
appropriate options below and list any additional options on the lines below: i.e. lift gates, 50° telestick boom,
emergency lighting package, light-bar, 60™ hydraulic rotary mower, etc. Please attach brochures if applicable:

ALL COUNTY VEHICLES ARE ORDERED WITH FOLLOWING STANDARD OPTIONS: Air Conditioning,
AM/FM Radio, Automatic Transmission, Rear Anti-Lock Brakes.

[ ] AM/FM/Cassette [ }Bed-Liner [ ]Limited Slip (3] Trailer Hitch Receiver
[ ] Amow Board * [ ] Strobe Light [ ]Power Win/Locks [ ] Tires— All Terrain

[ ]Long Bed [ 1Floor — Carpet [ 1Seats - Cloth [ ]Tow Package

{ ]Short Bed [ ]Floor — Rubber [ ]Seats - Vinyl [ ]Windows - Tinted

Pintle Wik 1o we  caa e.um4wa((\,1 puldl g

6. WHAT WILL BE THE PRIMARY USE OF THE NEW EQUIPMENT OR VEHICLE?

—
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Fleet Use Only: # o(% g DCM

Ver. 3.2
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LEE COUNTY GOVERNMENT, DIVISION OF FLEET MANAGEMENT

EQUIPMENT AND VEHICLE REQUEST FORM
(PLEASE PRINT OR TYPE)

7. FUNDING SOURCE:
[ ] Vehicle Replacement Fund

[\/éapital, Please Specify Account String KH 5 7;’-}0} S SE )() . 5@ (_9 (1[30

[ ]Other, Please Specify Account String

If needed, please provide additional account strings:

8. WE ARE AUTHORIZING A PURCHASE NOT TO EXCEED: § __ (0,000

Wit bl
REQUESTED BY ,[,{ M;‘% i T 1“%21;?% DATE
J o= 4/4/ /// 7/01*’

2" LEVEL APPROVAL DATE ISION DIRECT O

Option 1: [ ] QUOTES AND REQUISITION. This option authorizes Fleet Management to obtain quotes and
authorizes Fleet Management to issue a requisition using the account string(s) provided above.

Option2:[ ] VEHICLE REPLACEMENT FUND PURCHASES. This option authorizes Fleet Management to
obtain quotes and authorizes Fleet Management to purchase the equipment or vehicle using motor pool
funds (formerly known as surcharge funds).

{ ﬂb\/O\JCf C / [/) ;ZTg DY

DEPAIfI‘MEN R
Mol s 847 ]1-1%- 07
"*TOUNTY MANAGER / DESIGNEE DATE

* REQUIRED FOR ALL PURCHASES BETWEEN $ 25,000 - $50,000.

SUBMIT THIS COMPLETED FORM TO FLEET MANAGEMENT

[ +KECOMMENDED [ JNRATT. 4&" C Lq/wb / 7)/?(7?/
| DAT

APROVED [ ]DECLINEDK—' 1/10/c&__
AT

5.0 Nigh Metel
[&.O Maunk.
__‘f{_'_(_)__;iA@‘

@749'%&/? s

FLEET ACQUISITION SP IALIST

Page 2 of 2 Ver. 32 Fleet Use Only: # ‘03 /W
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.P_oﬁnLawesw-_Replacement Dun’{b Truck ~

From: Cindy Mitar

To: Lawes, Don

Date: 2/26/03 10:48AM

Subject: Replacement Dump Truck
Don,

Please accept this e-mail as authorization for you to proceed with the purchase of a 17.5 ton capacity dual
axle dump truck. | understand the original price was at $60,000 and now it is at $65,000. You have cur
permission to proceed with this purchase at the higher price.

Thank you.
Cindy

Cindy Mitar

Fiscal Manager, Parks & Recreation
mitarcc@leegov.com

(239) 461-7414

(239) 461-7420 FAX

CC: DeBacker, Joe



MATERIAL REQUEST FORM

Non-Surcharge

LC FORMALQUOTE# it o PBOB0360 / COLLIER CO.# 94-2268

FL SHER] ‘ : LCINFORMAL QUOTE # .- = .

STOF FLT - XXX KKK OTHER# =i, 1 ir oo s R

BOARD DATE: RP.O.#. PO -

VENDOR: " INTERNATIONAL TRUCK & ENGINE CORP. VENDOR # 211589
2400 COMMERCE AVE BIGD 1100, SUITE 100 DULUTH GA 30096

ORDER CONEIRMED BY: BILL PARHAM PHo 1-678 - 584 - 2777 DELIVERY:: 120

1-678- 584 - 2793

LEE COUNTY 5?::5_?' e

FLEET MANAGEMENT SPEC # 03-049 A Qry:
INTERNATIONALTRUCKS CAB AND CHAS, MODEL 5600 6X4,177 W/BASE 102CA , 63 AXLE TQ FRAME BASE PRICE 1 $ 49,757.00
OPTION: AUTOMATIC AIR BRAKE PACKAGE (8013} 1 $ 539.00
NON CONTRACT OPTIONS: 1600 LB FRONT AXEL AND SPRINGS ! ¥ 1,419.00
12.25 DC RIMS FRONT 22.5" ILO 8.25 DC ! ¥ 427.00
DUAL FUEL 70 FUEL TANKS ! $ 268.00
{2) 385/65R22.5 18 PLY FRONT TIRES ILO 295\75R22.5 ! ¥ 457.00
HORIZONTAL MUFFLER AND VERTICAL TAIL PIPE WITH EXHAUST TURNOUT 1 $ 55.00
1 $ 838.00
1 $ -
$ -
$ -
Complete set of manuals or CD to include, repair, operators, electrical and parts. { one set per truck) $ -
Tags and registrations are required for this vehicles. Theie will be supplied by Fleet. $ -
The total cost. J 3
APPROVED BY: Donat Lawes %/ 02/26/03

Fleet Acquisition Specialist [ 0"7
BY: Marilyn Rawlings

Fleet Manager / Vi

02/26/03
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070-700-02-1 = Medium and Heavy Trucks Page 1 of 1

ATTACHMENTA Z

Medium and Heavy Trucks
070-700-02-1

Effective: 1/7/02 through 5/31/03

Certification
Special Conditions
Exhibit A - Specifications
Exhibit B - Price Sheet
Exhibit C - Truck Bodies

Exhibit E - Notice of Non-Contract Purchase
Exhibit F - Certification of Compliance
Exhibit G - Acknowledgement of Order
Exhibit H - Ordering Instructions
Revigions
Complete Contract

http://fen.state. fl.us/st_contracts/(070700021/ 3/10/2003



[Contract Number] -- Vendor Information Page 1 of 1

Exhibit “B”

Trucks: Medium and Heavy
070-700-02-1

o _ . ; e _ S S S S S PO P o .. . ey

T T Specifications and Price Sheets

070-700-100 Chassis-Cab, Single Axle, Class 6, 24.500 GVWR 4x2 -~
070-700-110 _ Dump Truck, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-120 Stake Body Truck, Single Axie, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-130  Dry Freight Truck, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
(070-700-230 Chassis-Cab, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-235 Chassis-Cab, Single Axle, Crew-Cab, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-240 Dump Truck, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-245 Dump Truck, Single Axle, Crew-Cab, Class 6, 24,500 GYWR 4x2
070-700-250 Stake Body Truck, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
(70-700-255 Stake Body Truck, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-260 _Dry Freight Truck, Single Axle, Class 6, 24,500 GVWR 4x2
070-700-300 Chassis-Cab, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 52.000 GVWR 6x4
070-700-310 Chassis-Cab, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 64,000 GVWR 6x4
070-700-400 8 YD Dump Truck, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 52,000 GVWR 6x4
070-700-450 12 YD Dump Truck, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 64,000 GVW 6x4
070-700-498 Truck Tractor, Single Axle, Class 8, 50,000 GCWR 4x2
070-700-500 Truck Tractor, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 80,000 GCWR 6x4
070-700-510 Truck Tractor, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 120,000 GCWR 6x4

http://fen.state. fl.us/st_contracts/070700021/exhibitB.htm 3/10/2003



070-700-300  CHASSIS-CAB, TANDEM AXLE, CLASS 8, 52,000 LB. GVWR (6X4)
(32)
(REV 10 JULY 2002}
NOTE: This Specification/Price List is not complete unless it is used in conjunction with General
Specifications All Medium And Heavy Trucks, GSAT-1.

INTENDED VEHICLE USE

THIS VEHICLE IS USED FOR INSTALLATION OF VARIOUS TYPES OF AFTERMARKET BODIES
AND EQUIPMENT. USED ALSO FOR TRANSPORTING A CRAWLER TRACTOR AND EQUIPMENT
FOR FOREST FIRE PREVENTION, AND TRANSPORTATION OF UP TO TWO INDIVIDUALS ON
PAVED AND UNPAVED, GRADED ROADS.

*STD GVWR 52,000 LBS.
STD PAYLOAD CAPACITY 36,450 LBS. (APPROX)

*GVWR - Gross Vehicle Weight Rating is the total weight of a fully equipped, fully loaded truck.
10.  ENGINE:

A Diesel engine, liquid cooled, with a minimum of 250 Gross HP and 800 Ibs.-ft. Gross Torque
(per the latest issue of SAE J1349), and a minimum displacement of 7.6L (466 C1D). The
following engines, or approved equivalent, are acceptable:

CUMMINS ISC: 8.3L (504 CID), 260 Gross HP, 800 Ibs.-ft. Gross Torque
INT DT-466: 7.6L (466 CID), 250 Gross HP, 800 Ibs.- ft. Gross Torque

Standard cooling system with antifreeze.

Premium rubber (Intemational Premium (EPDM), Gates Blue Stripe or approved equivalent) or
silicone radiator hoses, by-pass hoses, heater hoses, and other coolant hoses.

Dry type air cleaner with service (restriction) indicator.

Engine protection system, at a minimum, must be activated by low engine oil pressure and high
engine temperature. System shall, at a minimum, include a warning light(s) and a derate
(rampdown) feature that will reduce engine power and speed, or shut down the engine when
any of these functions exceed normal limits.

F. Horizontal exhaust.

mo aw

12.  ELECTRICAL SYSTEM:

A Minimum 100 amp 12 v, alternator.
B. Batteries to have a minimum total of 1100 CCA @ 0 degrees F.

20.  TRANSMISSION: Minimum 6-speed automatic transmission with PTO opening(s). Allison
MD3560-P or approved equivalent.

150



30.

40.

50.

60.

AXLES & SUSPENSION:

D.

Steel front axle and suspension with shock absorbers, if available, minimum 12,000 Ib. GAWR.
Front whee! oil- tubricated bearings and seals.

Single speed tandem drive rear axle, minimum 40,000 tb. GAWR. Rear axle ratio is to be 5.86
or the closest possible ratio available. Rear suspension must have minimum 52 inch steel
walking beams. Hendrickson RT2-400/RT403 or approved equivalent,

NOTE TO CONTRACTOR: THIS TRUCK MUST BE CAPABLE OF PROVIDING A TOP
SPEED OF APPROXIMATELY 65 MPH AT THE PUBLISHED GOVERNED RPM FOR
THE ENGINE SPECIFIED.

Front wheel hubs and rear axles shall be filled with synthetic lubricant.

PERFORMANCE ITEMS:

A

B.

Factory installed speedometer; odometer, ammeter or voltmeter, fuel gauge, engine oil pressure
gauge, coolant temperature gauge, tachometer, air pressure gange and dash-mounted engine
hourmeter,

Power steering.

COMFORT ITEMS:

moOws

Factory installed AM-FM radio.

Fresh air heater and defogger.

Arm rests both sides, if available; sunvisors, both sides.
Tinted glass all windows, including windshield.

Air conditioning.

SAFETY ITEMS:

Dual electric homs.

Daytime running lights.

Stainless steel or aluminum outside mirrors and brackets, left and right side. Mirrors to be
large West Coast type, 6 inches x 16 inches minimum, to include stainless steel lower convex
spot mirrors on both sides.

Automatic-adjustable volume backup alarm. Must meet latest issue of SAE J994, Type B,
107dB(A). Factory or dealer installed.

Rain Flaps: Splash and spray suppressant rain flaps, straight prass type, to be installed on
heavy-duty hangers. Factory or dealer installed.

NO CONTRACTOR ADVERTISING, OR IDENTIFICATION WILL BE PERMITTED ON
RAIN FLAPS.

All access steps shall be self-cleaning slip-resistant grating.

151



62.

70.

80.

82.

90.

BRAKES:

A

ABS air brake system, minimum 13.2 cfm air compressor, and air reservoir(s) with automatic
moisture ejector valve(s) (not heated).

B. Moisture ejector valve(s) not to be mounted on bottom of air tank if at all possible. Side or
remote location(s) preferred.

C. Spring applied parking brake with in-cab parking brake control.

D. Automatic slack adjusters, front and rear.

E. Brake dust shields.

F. Outboard mounted brake drums, front and rear. (NOTE: Allows brake repair without
removing axle hubs.)

G. Low air pressure warning indicator in cab.

H. Air dryer with heater. Allied-Signal/Bendix AD-9 or AD-1P, Wabco System Saver 1200 or
approved equivalent.

TIRES & WHEELS:

A. Ten (10) 11R22.5G {(14PR) or larger, tubeless, radial tires with on/off highway tread for rear
only and highway tread for front. Rear tires to be Bridgestone M711, Goodyear G124/G164
RTD, Michelin XM+S84/XDE M/S or approved equivalent.

B. All wheels to be one-piece steel disc, 10-hole, 1.S.0. hub pilot mount, 22.5 inch diameter.

C. Front, inside rear and outside rear wheels to be fully interchangeable.

CHASSIS, FRAME, CAB:

mEoa

Minimum 52,000 Ib. GVWR, factory certified.

Minimum 2,400,000 in-1b. RBM to rear end of frame, factory reinforced if necessary. SEE
NOTE 1 Of Specification GSAT-1.

Cab-axle dimension of 156 inches to 157 inches.

Factory installed, step-type steel fuel tank(s), minimum 70 U.S. gallon total capacity.

Front tow hooks or tow pins or center mounted recessed tow hook.

Standard front bumper.

CAB EQUIPMENT:

C.
D.
E

Conventional cab, with tilt-type hood and fender assembly.
Alir suspension driver seat with matching fixed base companion seat. Seats to be a high back or
medium back with headrest. The same Manufacturer must provide both seats. Bostrom,
EzyRider, National CushN-Aire, Sears, or approved equivalent.

Exterior grab handles both sides.

Manufacturer’s standard paint and colors.

Rear cab window with fixed tinted glass.

CONDITIONS: Contractor shall provide a Manufacturer’s print-out (Ford “DORA”, Freightliner
“Spec Pro”, “GM AutoBook”, International “Vehicle Specifications”, Mack “Order/Customer/Vehicle
Information”, Sterling “Spec Pro”, or approved equivalent) to verify the Vehicle meets all the

requirements of this Specification. Also, any dealer installed aftermarket components, if specified,

152



must be noted on the Manufacturer’s print-out. All enclosed Conditions and Requirements shall apply.
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070-700-300

(32)
MAKE: INTERNATIONAL
CONTRACTOR - DISCOUNT* MODEL PRICE
Western District INTERNATIONAL 480.00 7000 Series 49.878.00 (A)
Northern District INTERNATIONAL 318.00 1000 Series 50.040.00 (B)

Central District INTERNATIONAL 222.00 7000 Series 50,136.00(C) )

Southern District INTERNATIONAL 450.00 7000 Series 49.,908.00 (D)

NOTE: ONLY THE ABOVE NAMED CONTRACTOR (S) IS/ARE AUTHORIZED TO SELL THIS
COMMODITY UNDER THIS CONTRACT!

*Discount for truck picked up by ordering agency at Contractor’s place of business.

Approximate delivery time required after receipt of order: 60 TO 90 DAYS

MAKE: STERLING

CONTRACTOR DISCOUNT* MODEL PRICE

Western District ATLANTIC TRUCK 10.00 LT 7500 48.846.00 (A)
Northern District ATLANTIC TRUCK 10.00 LT 7500 48,846.00 (B)
Central District ATLANTIC TRUCK 10.00 LT 7500 48,846.00 (C)
Southern District ATLANTIC TRUCK 10.00 LT 7500 48,846.00 (D)

NOTE: ONLY THE ABOVE NAMED CONTRACTOR (8) 1IS/ARE AUTHORIZED TO SELL THIS
COMMODITY UNDER THIS CONTRACT!

*Discount for truck picked up by ordering agency at Contractor’s place of business.
Approximate delivery time required after receipt of order: 60-120 DAYS
OPTIONS: 070-700-301-Option, Chassis-Cab, Tandem Axle, Class 8, 52,000 Ib. GVWR (6x4)
OPTIONS: (INT) INTERNATIONAL TRUCK; (AT) ATLANTIC TRUCK

(H 1002. Delay in warranty start date to allow for body installation. (Warranty to become
154



)

()

(4)

(3)

effective when Vehicle is placed in service rather than at time of delivery).

(INT) PRICE: N/C
(AT) PRICE: N/C

(INT) CUSTOMER MUST ADVISE INTERNATIONAL WHEN UNIT IS PLACED IN
SERVICE

1003. Extended engine warranty, covering 100% of parts and labor for all engine parts
between crankshaft pulley and flywheel. Bid for a period of 60 months/150,000
miles/6500 hours. The remaining terms, other than the above, to be in accordance with
the engine Manufacturer’s published warranty which 1s closest to each warranty Bid.
Submit two copies of the standard engine warranty and of each special warranty Bid.
Also, submit two copies of all extended engine warranties that are normally available to
commercial customers and commercial list prices for same.

(INT) PRICE: 455.00
(AT) PRICE: 627.00
(INT) WARRANTY UPDATE FORM WILL BE INCLUDED WITH DELIVERY PACKET

(NOTE TO ELIGIBLE USER: CONSULT THE DEALER FOR EXACT COVERAGE OF THIS
WARRANTY)

2001. Power take-off (PTO) with a SAE standard, keyed output shaft, installed. To include a
dash mounted electric-over-air switch and indicator light. Chelsea 230, Muncie CS
Series or approved equivalent. For manual transmission only. Indicate Manufacturer
and model.

MANUFACTURER: CHELSEA MODEL NO.: 230
(INT) PRICE: 1,051.00

(AT) PRICE: 1,049.00
(NOTE TO ELIGIBLE USER: USE WITH MANUAL TRANSMISSION ONLY)

2002, “Hot Shift” power take-off (PTO) with a SAE standard, keyed output shaft, installed.
To include a dash mounted electric-over-hydraulic switch and indicator light. Chelsea
276, Muncie CS Series or approved equivalent. For automatic transmission only,
Indicate Manufacturer and model.

MANUFACTURER: CHELSEA MODEL NO.: 276

(INT) PRICE: 1,135.00
(AT) PRICE: 1,195.00

(NOTE TO ELIGIBLE USER: USE WITH AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION ONLY)

2003. Electronic PTO overspeed control. Chelsea, Muncie or approved equivalent. Indicate
Manufacturer and model.
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6) 2006
(7) 3002,
(8) 3003,
(9 5002,
(10) 5003,
(11) 6003

MANUFACTURER: CHELSEA MODEL NO.: EOC

(INT) PRICE: 331.00
(AT) PRICE: 274.00

Direct drive manual transmission with PTO opening(s) and a minimum of ten forward
speeds. Transmission must have a minimum low gear reduction of 19.00:1.
Transmission shall be filled with synthetic lubricant. Minimum 14 inch diameter two-
plate ceramic-faced clutch. Indicate Manufacturer and model.

MANUFACTURER: SPICER MODEL NO.: PS-86 10V

(INT) PRICE (CREDIT); (5.461.00)
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (5,835.00)

“No-Spin” or automatic positive locking differential for the rearmost axle or both rear
axles.

(INT) PRICE: 520.00
(AT) PRICE: 565.00

Driver control traction differential (DCDL) for the rearmost axle or both rear axles.

(INT) PRICE; 824.00
(AT) PRICE: 371.00

Delete air conditioning.

(INT) PRICE (CREDIT): (585.00)
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (487.00)

Rain shields over door windows, both sides. Auto Ventshade Co. (1-800-241-7219) or
approved equivalent. Factory or dealer installed.

(INT) PRICE: 35.00
E:

(AT) PRICE: 71.00

Air horn(s), single base, mounted under the cab or hood. Roof mounted horns are not
acceptable,

(INT) PRICE: 279.00
(AT) PRICE: 67.00
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(12)

(13)

(14)

(15)

6004.

6204,

7001.

8001.

Front clearance indicators. Factory or dealer installed. (Indicators shall be
approximately 36 inches in length located on the lefi and right front corners of the
Vehicle.)

(INT) PRICE: 41.00
(AT) PRICE: 35.00

Automatic air brake drain system. ClearDrain System or approved equivalent. Bid in
licu of the air dryers specified in Section 62. H. Unit must be installed by the Vehicle
Manufacturer. Dealer installed units are not acceptable. SEE SPECIFICATION ADS-
1.

(INT) PRICE: 611.00
(AT) PRICE: 563.00

Ten (10) 275/80R22.5G (14PR) or 295/75R22.5G or larger, tubeless, low profile, radial
tires with highway tread.

(INT) PRICE: 96.00
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (206.00)

Pintle hook, installed. To be swivel type and must have a capacity of 49,000 1bs. gross
trailer weight and 9800 lbs. vertical load, minimum. Holland Model PH-760, Wallace
Model B30 or approved equivalent. Indicate Manufacturer and model.

MANUFACTURER: WALLACE MODEL NO.: B-30

(INT) PRICE: 394.00

MANUFACTURER: WALLACE/HOLLAND MODEL NO.: B-30/PH-760

(AT) PRICE: 395.00

(NOTE TO ELIGIBLE USER: ELIGIBLE USER MUST SPECIFY BODY LENGTH AND TYPE
(DUMP, STAKE, ETC.) IN ORDER FOR THE DEALER TO INSTALL THE PINTLE HOOK IN THE
PROPER LOCATION)

(16)

8002.

Optional cab-axle dimension (CA) 84 inches. Minimum 1,900,000 in-1b RBM frame.
SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE (CREDIT): (535.00)
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (1,615.00)
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(17)

(18)

(19)

20

1)

(22)

(23)

8003.

8004.

8005.

8006.

8007.

8008.

8014.

Optional cab-axle dimension (CA) 96 inches. Minimum 1,900,000 in-1b RBM frame.
SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE (CREDIT): (535.00)
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (1,615.00)

Optional cab-axle dimension (CA), 102 inches to 103 inches., Minimum 2,400,000 in-1b
RBM frame. SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE{CREDIT); (379.00)
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (732.00

Optional Cab-axle dimension (CA), 120 inches to 121 inches. Minimum 2,400,000 in-
1b RBM frame. SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE (CREDIT): (379.00)
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (692.00)

Optional cab-axle dimension (CA) 138 inches to 139 inches. Minimum 2,400,000 in-1b
RBM frame. SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE: N/C
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (574.00)

Optional cab-axle dimension (CA) 168 inches to 169 inches. Minimum 2,400,000 in-1b
RBM frame. SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE: 260.00
(AT) PRICE: N/C

Optional cab-axle dimension (CA) 150 inches. Minimum 2,400,000 in-ib RBM frame.
SEE NOTE 1 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-].

(INT) PRICE (CREDIT): N/C
(AT) PRICE: (320.00)

Air brake package for straight truck and trailer. Full trailer air brake controls with
airlines, glad hands and wiring routed to the rear end of the frame.

_(INT) _PRICE: 539.00
(AT) PRICE: 356.00
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(24)

(25)

(26)

27

(28)

(29)

8201. Special state color. DOT Yellow (DuPont Centari L9069A, Freightliner/Sterling 3258,
Navistar 4421). SEE NOTE 3 OF SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(NT) PRICE: N/C
(AT) PRICE:( CREDIT) (83.00)

8203. Special colors. Other than Manufacturer’s and the one listed in option 8201,

(INT} PRICE: 196.00
(AT) PRICE: N/C
(INT) MUST PROVIDE COLOR NUMBER, MAY REQUIRE PAINT CHIP

8218. Special state colors, two-tone. White (DuPont Centari K9031A, Freightliner/Sterling
0007, Navistar 9219) above dripstrip on cab and DOT Yellow (DuPont Centari
L9069A, Freightliner/Sterling 3258, Navistar 4421) on remainder of cab. SEE NOTE
OF 3 SPECIFICATION GSAT-1.

(INT) PRICE: 160.00
(AT) PRICE (CREDIT): (83.00)

8219. Air suspension passenger seat. Seat to be a high back or medium back with headrest.
The same Manufacturer as the driver seat must provide passenger seat. Bostrom,
EzyRider, National Cush-N-Aire, Sears, or approved equivalent. Bid in lieu of the base
passenger seat specified in Section 82.B.

(INT) PRICE: 145.00
(AT) PRICE: 233.00

R8220. Two-tone colors. Manufacturer’s standard two-tone color.

(INT) PRICE: 160.00
(AT) PRICE: 122.00

(INT) MUST PROVIDE COLOR NUMBER

8221. Special colors, two-tone. Special two-tone colors other than the one listed in option
8218.

(INT) PRICE: 299.00
(AT) PRICE: 122.00

(INT) MUST PROVIDE COLOR NUMBER, MAY REQUIRE PAINT CHIP
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March 5, 2003

Don Lawes
Lee County, FL

Don,

Per your request please find specifications and pricing off the State of FL contract
# 070-700-02-01 for a cab and chassis to accommodate an 8 yard dump.

070-700-300 Base Central Dist § 50,136.00
Qptions
8004 177" W.B.,, 102"CA,; 63"AF, (379.00)
08014 Air Brake Package 539.00
Non-Contract
1. 16,000 1b Front Axle and Springs 1,419.00
2. Dual 70 gallon Fuel Tanks 266.00
3. 12.25 DC Rims Front 22.5" ilo 8.25DC 427.00
4, (2) 385/65R22.5 18 ply Front Tires 457.00
5. RT40-145 “P” 4900 ib Rear Axle 55.00
6. Horizontal Muffler and Vertical tail Pipe 89.00
with exhaust turnout
Total $53,009.00
Please review the enclosed specs.
o

If you have any qucstions, please do' not hesitate to call me.

Sincerely,

W. J. Parham

National Account Manager
678-376-0069
770-963-3083 - Fax
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Prepated For:

Lucomty F Chasuis for 8 yd dumnp
mEmw.y

Telshasess, FL. 32208
(Z39)TI-3233

Reference 1D N/A
APPLICATION:
IS MION:

FUEL ECONONY:
DIMENSION:

KT AL L MY e

2004 7405 $HA 024 farean

Conmntion Dasmp

Requesind GVWR: 52000, Cale. GWVWR: 56000

Calc. Start / Gradu Abiity: 24.1% /1.53% § 55 MPN,

Caic. Geered Spoed: 68 .85 WPH.

7.7 MPG § 55 WPH

Wimaleer: 177, GA: 102, Usshin CA: 102., Axde fo Frame: 83

Faberuary 28, 2003

Proswrdsd By:
irtarratioral Truck and Engne Corp.
Pwtam

Bs

2400 COMMERICE AVE
BLD. 1100 - SUITE 100
DULUTH, GA 3058568
(678)584.27T7

ENGINE, DIESEL: WDWWTW}MHﬂMWFMSMSDM275HPOm
RPM. B0 -8 Torgue (@ 1200 RPM, 2200 RPM Goverrwd Speed, 285 Pesk HP (Max) Inchudes #2 Bal!

TRANSMIBSION, AUTOMATKC:
CLUTCH:
AXLE, FRONT, 1BEAM TYPE:

Housing

{Alison MO-3560P) Wide Ratip, $-Spewd; With PTO Gear rd Lwas Retarder

Qmit hem {Chach & Conirgl)
[Derm Gplowr H160W) Wida Track, 16.000-b Capadity

AXLE, REAR, TANDEM: {Murior RT40-145P} Singie Rechuction 40.000-b Capacly With Lubs Od Pump snd 200 Whasd Ends

GABR:

TIRE, FRONT;

TIRE, REAR:

BUSPENSION, REAR, TANDEM:

Gaar Ralic: 4 78
Carrearsionl, Steel

(2) MSRERZ2 5 UNISTEEL G295 (GOODYEAR; 460 revimile, laad range J, 18 ply
(8) ZRSABRZZ. S UNISTEEL G159 (GOODYEAR) 517 rewimile, 1oad renge G, 14 ply
{Heriickeon RT-405] Watking Beam Type 52 Axe Specing: 40,000 & Capecity With Rubher Canter

Bushinge



February 25, 2003
INTRRNATIONAL W
' 2004 7480 SFA Gxé (AFS25)

Soge

EFE2™0
15870
1CAJ

1LLA

WGn

WDE

4183

4819
I

485
ANGCE

4580

Dagcsintion

Baws Chessis, Mool 7400 EFA 8X4 with 177 Whealkees, 102 CA, 102 Uashin CA, ard 63 Axis to Frarm.

TOW HOOK, FRONT (2) Frame Mounted.

FRAME RAILS Hanl Tregtud Aoy S (120,000 F8! Yisld); 10.008" x 362" x 0.433° (276.0rrn x 82.Ormym 1 1.7 mm); 456.07 (11582mm)
Meximum OAL

BUMPER, FRONT Stws, Swapt Back

AL NOTE: Powiw Cased Grey (Argert) Caks

WHEELBASE RANGE 177 {460cm) Through and Inckafing 229" (375am)

AXLE, FRONT, 1L.BEAM TYPE {Durm Spicar -100W]) Wide Track, 16,000 Capacity
SUSPENGION, FRONT, SPRING Peaboio, Trpar Laet. 16,000-5 Capachy; With Shock Abwcrbets

inchoden

: SPRING PINS Rubbar Bushinge, Mainkenance-Fres

BRAKE SYSTEM, AIR Oual Syshem ky Struight Truck Appiicstons

: AIR COMPRESSOR AIR SUPPLY LINE Thveaagh Alr Clamrr

: BRAKE CHAMBERS, SPRING (4) Resr Parking

: BRAKE LUNES Color Codad Nylon

- DUST SHIELDS, REAR BRAXE

: DUST SMIELDS, FRONT BRAKE

1 BLACK ADJUSTERS, FRONT Autortic

: SLACK ADJUSTERS, REAR Autormeic

. PARIGNG BRAKE VALVE Color-Coted Yellow Knob, Locaiad on Irstrumert Panel
: GRAJN VALVE Twisk-Type

: BPRING BRAKE MODULATOR VALVE

: GAUGE. AIR PRESSURE Locaiad In bretrutnent Clusier Axr 1 wnd Alr 2 Gauges,

BRAKES, FRONT, AIR CAM 18.5™ x €7, includes 24 Sqin Long Syoks Chambers

R i D5, FRONT BRAXE

TRAILER CONNECTIONS Four-ihes, With Herd Cartrol Vaive end Tractar Protaction Vaive. for Sraight Traek
DRAIN VALVE, AUTOMATIC (B DV-Z] With Heatw; for Af Terk |

AIR BRAKE ABS {Burta ArelLock Brakm Syvtarn) Full Vehiols Wrel Cantrol Systam (4-Ghenne)

AIR DRYER {Bariix AD-5) WEn Hoaser

BRAKES, REAR, AIR CAM 16.5" x 7.0, inciudes MGM TRZ0G0 Long Svies Brasan Chamber and MHaevy Duty Spring Aciusted Purking Brake

lochdue
: BRAKE CHAMBERS, SPRING invarisd with ALL “Waking Baar” type Suspensions

AIR COMPRESSOR {Bonaix Tu-Fio 5504 13.2 CFM
STEERING COLUMN Sinfcrmry

STEEAING WHEEL 3-Rjiihe, 18° Glun., Bick
GTEERWQ GEAR (2) (Shwppard M-100/M-80) Dust Poser

EXMALIT SYSTEM Sicge, Horgorel MuMer Vel Tol Pgs, Ausridond S nchio ol Pgs Guard;Frame Moursed Rigt Side BOG,

ELECTRICAL SYSTEM 12-Vok, Sandurd Equipmant

Propcasd: 1797



I MTERNATIONAL W Eehruty 24, 2003
2004 7490 BFA kx4 (9F$26)

Qode

a51e

aMED
BREY

8TMG

BACL

owPpP

PNAY

10080

19781
10WYZ
11001
12NMX

Descitstion

rciudos

:mmmmmwwmmms&.mum
:WRNWWWMWWMMTMFM)
:wmsmwmmms-xrw.mmmm

T HOR K S

:Pmmnﬂﬁocmwwmﬂmmmuthm
:STOP,TURN.TNL&WUUGHTSMRﬂ,mwm

| STARTER SWITCH Blectric Kiry Dpaiated
?mnsm.%mfmmmmdws&mqs@ﬂ. Boll State Finshars;

. WIRING, CHAGSIS Calar Cosiext and Conbinuously

CIGAR LIGHTER

BOOY BUILDER WIRING Back of Cab ot Frism, inciudes Sasisd Carvactons far TaliAmber Tum/Marker Backup/Acomsmary Powen/Ground
w0 Sandes) Corveior Tor Biop/Tum

BATTERY SYSTEM {tamatiora) Mairtenance-Fres (2) 12-Vok 1100CCA Totai

RADIO (Parmmnic COR-111) AM/FM, Wik Cammtia Pityer, inokuies Niticis Dund Core Spuskrs
{ QPEAKERS IN CAS (4) Cosxinl with Presmium irsarior

: SPEAKERS IN CAB (2) Dusi-Cone wih Deko fbericr

BACKUP ALARM Elterric, 102 dBA

TRAILER CONNECTION SOCKET 7 \Way; Mawrted 3t reer of Frame, Wirsd for Tum Signals Combined With Siop, Cormpstitle Witk Tralers
Treat Uss Cambived Siep., Tak, Tum Larps

HORN, AIR {Grovar) Black, Sigls Trumpet, Alr Scianold Oparsied, Mourted Bahind Bumper on Right Red

ENGINE SHUTDOWN Aulomatic: Wit 0 Seoard Delsy, Wi iisrrmticrel Engines

ALTERNATOR {Lamas-Narvile BLMAZ0SAUAH]) 12 Vok, 110 Amp, Brush Type

INDICATOR, LOW COOLANT LEVEL Wath AudRie Alermn

STARTING MOTOR {Lamc-Neviis M3Q] 12-VOF; lsmx Thermat Over-Lrank Protection

CIRCUIT BREAKERS Marusi-Resat (Main Parwl) SAE Typs it With Trip indicstors, Replaces Al Fuses Exoapt For 5-Arp Funes
GRILLE Civesne ' '

FRONT ENO Titing, Farplems, With Thas Pisce Connuction

PAINT BCHEMATIC, PT-1 Singis Color, Design 100

%&cmm:owmsw

PAINT TYPE Base Comt/Clasr Cost, 1-2 Tana
QUALIFICATION IDENTITY for Non-Disnorsd SPET Vehicle
CLUTCH Omi e (Chich & Cartral)

ENGINE, DIESEL (Irteationsd DTS30 Sxandans Torque) F . '
© 1200 RPN, Z200 RPA Govamad Baad 205 Peas 1P (M) eanios 2 B e 21 @ 000Z00 RPM, 600 B4 Toros

Ionkalen

: CRURSE CONTROL Elactranic; Corirale integral & Seaaring Whee!
: WET TYPE CYUNDER GLEEVES

Propasal: 1707
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: Fabruary 15, 2003
INTERNATIONAL" Yahiie Soecifcations

Segs

12THL

12UVX

12VBC
12WW

1vXT
13484

1wBN
12wWLD
15W7A
14GRC

T4WAL
14WLD
15DMR

16010

2004 TA90 SFA dxé (BFE2S)

: ENGINE SHUTDOWN Elsctic, Kay Doersted
: GOVERNOR Rowd Spead, Elscironic
%T.ETEOALQWSLUGM

TOILFI NGIN W')‘Pﬂ
;mmmmmmmcwy
:F CRANKSWW

: Aﬂw

. FUEL FILTER Enging WMounind

FAN ORIVE {Hartm Orvumasiar) Aisiomeiic On/ON Typs Control, With Normally Cioeed Tomparature Contrel; Unas With rermational 16 Englie

Incudes

; FAN Nyien
WTORGMFN.MWMMW%:WTWMWGHMAMW1@M‘lm&m
- ANTRFREEZE Ghall Fiowiin Extanded LNe Coolerd -40F (-40C)

: DEAERATION SYSTEM with Polyprapyiare Tuk

- RADIWATOR HOSES Pramusm, Rubiber

AR CLEANER Singls Basant

ENGINE CONTROL, REMOTE MOUNTED Proiwon for; inchudas Wiring far Body Buider instalistion of PTQ Cantrots; With Ignition Switch
Control

THROTTLE, HAND GONTROL Engine Speed Contral; Ectronic, Btliormery, Veriedis Spmid; Mouniad on Steerng Whee!
TRANSMIBSION, AUTOMATIC (Alison MO-360P) Wids Rutio, 5-Spesd; With PTO Gew and Lems Retarder

%msmumpmmhmm

TRANSMISSION BHIFT CONTROL {Aliwon) T-Bar Typet for Aliaon MD & MO Trarsmission
TRANSMISSION OIL {Castrel TranSyrd Synthweic; 20 tu 42 Pirks

ALLISON WT SPARE INPUT/OUTPUT for Genaral Truck, Uiy, Refuss, Dump, Bus ard Picins & Delivary

&amgmmmu1mwnmmmwmmmwmwuw

\rciuden
: REAR AXLE DRAIN PLUG (2) Magneys
: POWER DMIDER LOCK Elsriric ovar Alr Oparated, Cab Cortrad with indicator Light

SUSPENSION, REAR, TANCEM (Hendrickesn RT@}WM Baam Type 52 Axle Soacing; 40,000-b Capaclty With Rubbwr Canter

BUSPENSIONREAR-AXLE IDENTITY for Mertor(Rockved) Tendem Renr Axses Wath far-Pin S Aactment Type Sutpensiona
AXLE, REAR, LUBE {EmGard 75W-0) Synthatic OF; 50 thu 64.90 P

:zgmusﬁz; Top Degw, D Styte, Sist, 70 U.S. Gal., 28%., Total Capecity 140 U.8. Gel., BOL; 19" Tank Depth, Mourted Under Cab Laf
inchxint

- FUEL LINES Nykon Tubing With O-Rirg Srmp-On Ghuick-Canvect Fitinga sl Both Ends

CAB Corversionsl, B

{Phudes

: UGHTS (5) Fush Mourses

: CLEARANCEMARKER
: ARM REST (2 Makivd Pragtic, Smoks Grey; Orm £ach Doar
: FLOCR COVERING Ruthar, Binck

: COAT HOQK Lacatod on Rewr Wal, Cardered Above Rear Windoe

¢ Proposas: 17%1
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. ' February 28, 2003
INTERNAYIGHAL" Yabvicis Specifications

Sods

16HBA

1BHGH
18JNT

16PH

1650N

168k
1605
16WKB

18WKY
T6WRXY,

183K
Z7DONP

2BDMA

2004 7490 SFA 434 (SFA25)

Reegtistion

. GRAB MANDLE, CAB INTERIOR (1) "A° Plar Meurdad, Pumsenger Gids

Emm%mgwmmmwu

: STEP (2) Twe Stepw Pas Dgaor

: GLASS, ALL WINDOWS Tirked

GAUGE CLUSTER English Wah English Etactranic Gpeadarmneter

:'mooouertin DISPLAY, Mias, Trip Misa, Ergine Hourw, Trip Houwrs, Tsuou::u:u - )

: WARNING BYBTEM Fusl, O Promuwity, Engine Coolant Ty, Gattery Vokage (Vausl Audibis .

‘gMJGE cx.fls’f‘ER GLAT‘JGEL:(B)ME'M' ol Pl'_‘”uw). Water Tamparshure (Electonic), Fusl (Elecyonic), Tactarmems© (Eisctranic),
Violrowter, Woshar Fluid Lavel

GAUGE, OIL TEMP, ALLISON TRAN '

sur.mwu(w&w.wummmwmmzm_vmcmmaw17

Dagren Saat Back Adpatymant, Air Lmber Support

h-. s!u’ -r'aeuram Lap and Sheuidar Bk Type

BEAT.PASSENGER{WNMMF@MWMWW.WMM

: BEAT BELT 3-Powt, Lap wid Shoulder Bek Type

MIRRORS (2) {\ang Mekra} Styled; Rectargulsy, 7.00" x 15.7%", Graciats Biwakeway Typs, With 102" Wide Spacing, WEh infegral Conves

GRAB HANDLE Chwome; Towsl By Type Ante-84p Rubbar iresarts; for Cab Endry Mounted Lai Sde Only
INSTRUMENT PANEL Cordar Seciion, Fist Panel

AR CONDITIONER {irtamational Blend-Alr} With (ringrel Ragter & Defrosear

: REFRIGERANT Hydrafiuorocarbon HFG-134A

: FRESH AIR FILTER

: MEATER MOSES Prerium

FRESH AIR FILTER for HVAC

CAB INTERIOR TRIM Dubocs

inchilen
:CONSOLEOVERHWWM%MWPM”WN&NOBRmWSMWW Blaek
Natling Over Sicrage Pockars

: INSTRUMENT PANEL TRIM Mckied Plastic, Drawhridg Gray wih Biack Cortar Hidden Cup Holer anc Ash
:WELIOW.WW.MMM?CMmmmdm' I"“P, icider arc Ash Tray (Pus-Out)
: SUN VIEOR (2) Paddacl Vinyl intagral ) Console with Tob Ticksl Sirag and with integral Extanders Grnemirg

; BTORAGE POCKET. DOOR (1) Mokdad P, Srreks Gy Fl-Lorgh Deber Door

| DOGR TRIM PANELS (2 Lickied Fiottc, Divr el Pasaanger Caors e oo Coverad

CAB REAR SUSPENSION Al Bug Type
WHEELS, FRONT DISC; 22.5% Painted Siewl, 10-5040 (285.75MM BC) Hub Pisted, Flarpad Nut. Motric Mourt, 12.25 OC Rirr; With Stael

Inchaie
; WHEEL SEALS, FRONT CH Lubriowssd, inshuges Wil Bensigs
WHEELS. REAR QUAL DISC; 226" Prinid Sies!, 10-50,d (286 7S C) Hub Pioted, Fargar Nt Metro Moure, 8.25 DG Rima; Wi Staal

s Proposal 179)



1Y RRMATIGNAL m‘ﬁ“‘ Eebruary 26. 2003
2004 7400 SFA 8a4 (5F829)

o9  Dusgtition

%SW. REAR OF Lutricuied, Inciudes Whael Basrings
2aWLA WHEEL BEARING, FRONT, LUBE (EmCans 5OW) Synthtic O3
TIUFEE0164 () TIRE, FRONT 308M56R22 5 UNISTEEL Q288 (GOCOYEAR) 480 revimile, knd range J, 18 ply
7722480179  (8) TIRE, REAR 298/75R22 5 UNISTEEL 8189 (GOODYEAR) 517 renchile, kad ranga G, 14 ply

Caty Bciuynatic 100GM
Loostion 1; 9219, WINTER WHITE

Chassis Scharmesic NVA
Garvices Section:

1OWNEID COMPENTIVE BURCHARGE GREIXT

T2UXC FEDERAL EMISSIONS for 2002, «r inmrroijonal VIS, Ta44E, DT406 and DTS Engines
Giad harcia

Proposet; 1797



INFORMAL QUOTE: IT030390 o LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA TABULATION SHEET ]
OPENING DATE: N/A FOR THE PURCHASE OF
BUYER: BOB FRANCESCHINI ONE (1) NEW DUMP TRUCK BODY
M
VENDORS HARDEE ACTION |
EQUIPMENT FABRICATION !
RAND TOTAL DELIVERED ™ ;
PRICE $ 10,130.12 | NO BID NO BID
|
1
i
; ;
!
i
NO BIDS

s #1INGNHOVLLY



Jim Hardee Equipment Company, Inc.
4220 Drane Fleld Road

Quotation

Quote Number:

2252
Lakeland, 33
Quote Date:
Feb 13, 2003
. Page:
Quoted to: 1
Lee County B.0.C.C.
P.Q, Drawer 2238
Fort Myers, FL. 33902-2238
941-338-3233
Customer 1D Good Thru Payment Terms ~ Sales Rep
9328 - 4/14/03 Net Due Janet Green
Quantlty Item Description Unit Price Extension
1.00 JIM HARDEE MODEL JHE212-30-8 12 10,130.12 10,130.12
DUMP BODY PER LEE COUNTY
SPECIFICATIONS
CHASSIS SHOULD HAVE AIR PACKAGE
FROM FACTORY
JIM HARDEE TO INSTALL
GLADHANDS AND PINTLE PACKAGE
PREPARED FOR: DON LAWES
. 3 C,‘.‘b "
cY P\e_(,\u\re_(‘l '
Subtotal 10,130.12
Sales Tax
Total 10,130.12
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R.W.C.

2240 J&C Blvd,
Naples Fl, 34109

CUSTOMER PRICE QUOTATION

Customer: DIV. OF FLEET MAN. Invoice #: 23478
. Date: ©02/27/03
FT MYERS F1 .33109 Code: WI
Clerk: SHARON
Contact: DON Ph#: .
UNITS DESCRIPTION
12 YARD DUMP (N/n)

1. FITS 3/4 TON CAB & CHASSIC (CAB TO AXLE 56")

2. PRICE INCLUDES INSTALLATION Sub Total:
3. PAINTED WHITE Sale Tax:
4. BUMPER

5. TAILGATE Potal:

6. FLUSH MOUNTED LIGHTS

QUOTATION GIVEN BY: SHARON

1. Unless cotherwise noted, terms are balance due on completion.

2. Quoted prices are valid through B1/08/03

3. Quoted prices are valid only if total units quoted are actually orderd from R.W.C.
4. Projected belivery: 1.6 Weeks after receipt of purchase order/Signed Quote.
5. Must be signed to start job, if job cancled must pay freight and restock charge.
6. Signed by:

Phone 941-598-2569 Fax 941-598-1401



Feb=¢h=¢Ul3  13:06 From=ACTION FABKILAIIUN [¢i D¢ 4y¥)y I=led P .UUL/VUC F=38¢

[AcTION

FABRICATION & TRUCK EQUIPMENT
1-800-330-1229
FAX: ( 727 ) 572-4918

SUBJECT: NO BID DATE: 02/26/03

ACTION FABRICATION WISHES TO NO BID
12 YARD TIPPER

ACTION DOES NOT OFFER A TIPPER BIGGER THAN 8 YARDS AT THE PRESENT TIME

JAY M. HUDGE

" MANUFACTURER OF QUALITY TRUCK gDIES "




ATTACHMENT #4</

Erquunncnl Inventory - FASTER 4,48.063a

' Equiplent Info ation: canpany 1901 'M”MF‘&[MMWN

.. Equipment Number Year Hake . . . - Hodel - - . r,iur.tty.'TSe{ ‘Location 111
P95 =i [ine ____j[4?90 o= e = ?r‘int| '
i -~Parent Eq“‘p“m“‘ Serial Number License - HG: gl
, - Companent - JIIHTSCABPOSHBAOSD] 80643 [o7 __j;uumpmucx
149429' inrm i | N B . ’
; {Colar - : Shop:- Flte .. -

jHES _j{rp
ﬁl)epcrtnnt
- dotar past _j] :ud(,l}uw s-?l:utm PARKS 155 __]F___

1 3TALUS 17 28 oo Employes " .- o L
Reservaﬂl‘m 1 L PR ity e F'I—EPE U'RRY ,.J?“EE 'PABKS HEC‘
Type [Cyoief Date Done | | oTe
" 11/28/2002 = -5|19J'merm?mm 330_PM
11/28/2002 g} o : e
QS IA7) 2007 4 Depreciacion 19234.00 Las “Uark D

Deparuent PZ

‘Ezpeczeﬁ LTte In Wters . T s
Type | Euel? | Date 1 Time = §  actuat] Acquire] @eginFY] -
4n X 1170871994 12:12:48 140420 o 136921

- j1f o5 |
; ) ek B LHe E!pectar\cy t‘lumhs I

emaintrg Lité - Répldceunsnt Replacenent: Henthly aecowerr . Current Life In'HonthsF‘mo
' 20 {‘ma‘s“f"‘zam f eresie [ sees _ ;

" 9 mAsTERf
e s




MEMORANDUM et Q \ .
FROM
THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING

DATE:MARCH 12, 2003

j,sm,.r lreenn
TO: MARILYN RAWLINGS FROM: JANET SHEEHAN, CPPB
FLEET MANAGER PURCHASING DIRECTOR
- o3
RE: BLUE SHEET # 20030304 | ¥
‘ B
PROJECT:  One (1) Dump Truck ; i
o
— 4 ‘4
TYPE: State Contract & Informal Telephone Quote Purchase '
AWARDED TO:

International Truck & Engine Corp. & Jim Hardee Equipment Co.

Attn, Ms. Rawlings — When you have finished your review of this package, please forward it to
John Yarbrough, Parks.

__> Attn. Mr. Yarbrough - When you have finished your review of this package, please forward it to
v |_Kristie Kroslack in the County Attorney’s Office.

If there are any questions or concemns with this package, please contact Bob Franceschini at 689-
7385.

=ECETVER




