Lee County Board Of County Commissioners Agenda Item Summary

Blue Sheet No. 20051807

- 1. ACTION REQUESTED/PURPOSE: Award B-05-22 ANNUAL NO DIG PIPE REHABILITATION AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES, for the Utilities Division, for Bid Packages A through F to the two (2) lowest responsive, responsible bidders meeting all bidding requirements as follows: Bid Package A American Water Services Underground Infrastructure, Inc., for a Not-To-Exceed amount of \$1,500,000.00 and Bid Package B Miller Pipeline Corporation, for a Not-To-Exceed amount of \$1,500,000.00; for the unit costs stipulated on the bid tabulation sheet. This contract will be for an initial two (2) year period with the possibility of being extended/renewed for one (1) additional one-year period. This project was in the CIP and funds will be available. Also, authorize Chairwoman to execute agreement upon completion.
- 2. WHAT ACTION ACCOMPLISHES: The project provides for utility system rehabilitation services over the three year period of the contract.

3. MANAGEMENT RECOMMENDATION: Staff recommends approval

4. Dep	artmental Category: 10	• • (C10 T		5. Meeting Date: 01-10-2006		
6. Agenda:		7. Requirement/Purpose: (specify)			8. Request Initiated:		
X	Consent		Statute		Commissigner,		
	Administrative		Ordinance		Department / Public Works		
	Appeals	X	Admin. Code	AC-4-4	Division Wallutto Hitroful 169 12-20		
	Public		Other		By: Rick Diaz, P.E., Director		
	Walk-On						

9. **Background:** The Utilities Division submitted a request to Contracts Management to obtain bids for the Annual No Dig Pipe Rehabilitation and Replacement Services. The expected cost of the project required the use of the formal advertised sealed bid procedure.

On the bidding deadline of October 19, 2005, Contracts received five (5) bids. The Utilities Division has reviewed the bids and it is being recommended that the award be made for Bid Packages A through F to the two (2) lowest responsive, responsible bidders meeting all bidding requirements as follows: Bid Package A - American Water Services Underground Infrastructure, Inc., for a Not-To-Exceed amount of \$1,500,000.00 and Bid Package B - Miller Pipeline Corporation, for a Not-To-Exceed amount of \$1,500,000.00, for the unit costs stipulated on the bid tabulation sheet. This contract will be for an initial two (2) year period with the possibility of being extended/renewed for one (1) additional one-year period.

In accordance with the Contract Documents "It is estimated that approximately \$1,500,000.00 (per package) worth of utility system rehabilitation services will be generated from this program to be completed over a three (3) year period...specific system rehabilitation purchase orders will be issued for any one (1) of the technologies and remideial construction services bid in this proposal. The County reserves the right to select the bid package and scope of work for each purchase order issued."

Funds will be available in account strings: 20724748720.503610, 20723348730.506310 & 20727048730.506310

Attachments: (1) Bid Tabulation

(2) Department Recommendation for Award										
10. Review for Scheduling:										
Department Director	Purchasing or Contracts	Human Resources	Other	County Attorney	Budget Services	an a	County Manager/P.W. Director			
2006	K TC	N/A د د د	N/A	- Transfer	Analyst Risk	Grants Mer.	James 1230.05			
11. Commission Action:										
	Approved Deferred Denied Other			cou S Cou	EIVED BY NTY ADMIN: 10 21/05 25 NTY ADMIN 10	Rec. by CoAtty Date: / I (05 Time: 10:05Am.				
				POR	WARDED 10: 1 0 132 165 14 20'	Forwarded To: Co. Admin. 1421 114m				

INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

PUBLIC WORKS UTILITIES



DATE: December 13, 2005

To: Cindy Logan, Contracts From: Tom Mamott, P.E.

RE: RECOMMENDATION FOR AWARD, BID NO. B-05-22
ANNUAL NO DIG PIPE REHABILITATION AND REPLACEMENT SERVICES

Lee County Utilities has reviewed the bid tabulations for Bid No. B-05-22. Total qualified bids received are as follows:

Bid Package A – Cured in Place Liner	4 bids
Bid Package B – Fold/Form PVC Pipe Liner	2 bids
Bid Package C – Fold/Form HDPE Pipe Liner	1 bid
Bid Package D – Tight Fitting PE Pipe Liner	0 bids
Bid Package E – HDPE Directional Drilling	0 bids
Bid Package F – Televising Gravity and Pressure Mains	1 bid

As stated in the Contract Documents, "it is estimated that approximately \$1,500,000.00 worth of utility system rehabilitation services will be generated from this program to be completed over a three (3) year period...specific system rehabilitation purchase orders will be issued for any one (1) of the technologies and remedial construction services bid in this proposal. The County reserves the right to select the bid package and scope of work for each purchase order issued."

Therefore, we recommend awarding Bid Packages A through F to the lowest responsive, responsible bidders as follows:

Bid Package A-

American Water Services Underground Infrastructure, Inc. Not-To-Exceed amount of \$1,500,000.

Bid Package B-

Miller Pipeline Corporation Not-To-Exceed amount of \$1,500,000.

Bid Package C-

Only one bid. No Award.

Bid Package D- No Award

Bid Package E- No Award

Bid Package F-Only one bid. No Award.

Please proceed with preparation of the necessary paperwork to the Board of County Commissioners. Thank you.

cc: Margaret Lincoln, Contracts
Ivan Velez, LCU
Jimmy Harper, LCU
David Sabiston, LCU

LEE COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

B-05-22

ANNUAL NO DIG PIPE REHABILITATION REPLACEMENT SERVICES

DATE: October 19, 2005 PACKAGE F NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PACKAGE "E" NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID PACKAGE TO-NO BID OIB ON ON BID NO BID NO BID PACKAGE"C" NO BID NO BID OIB ON OIB ON \$49.25 PACKAGE"B" NO BID NO BID NO BID \$52.50 \$37.38 PACKAGE "A" OIB ON \$103.10 \$114.03 \$104.70 \$95.25 BID-BOND (\$75,000) \$75,000.00 \$75,000.00 \$75,000.00 \$75,000.00 \$75,000.00 2601 W. Lake Mary Bivd., Ste 129 Lake Mary, FL 32746 Phone: 407.472.0097 Jeans Rerounding & Testing Inc. DBA Williams Testing Inderground Infrastructure, Inc. Deerfield Beach, FL 33441 Phone: 954.973.9700 Fax: 954.974.3894 -anzo Lining Services, Inc. Miller Pipeline Corporation Orleans, IN 47452-0186 Phone: 812.865.3232 Fax: 812.865.3075 merican Water Services 8850 Crawfordsville Rd. Indianapolis, IN 46234 BID NO: B-05-22 4520 N. State Road 37 Phone: 317.293.0278 Reynolds Inliner, LLC Sarasota, FL 34277 Phone: 941.921.7304 Fax: 317.295.6410 Fax: 407.472.0097 Fax: 941.925.1901 Fred Tingberg 125 SE 5th Court Suzan Dunlop P.O. Box 15877 CONTRACTOR P.O. Box 34141 . Alan Smith arry Purlee rim Bixler

Updated: 12/20/2005