
B200323B]B El Contract # __ _ 

Purchase and Supply of Mulch - Annual 
Forestry Resources, LLC 

Board Approval Date: __ _ 

AGREEMENT FOR 
PURCHASE AND SUPPLY OF MULCH - ANNUAL 

THIS AGREEMENT ("Agreement") is made and entered into by and between Lee 
County, a political subdivision of the State of Florida, hereinafter referred to as the 
"County" and Forestry Resources, LLC, a Delaware Limited Liability Company 
authorized to do business in the State of Florida, whose address is 4353 Michigan 
Link, Fort Myers, FL 33916, and whose federal tax identification number is 59-
2438601, hereinafter referred to as "Vendor." 

WITNESS ETH 

WHEREAS, the County intends to purchase various types of mulch, pine straw, 
decorative shell, etc., for different types of landscaping, throughout the County, on 
"as needed" basis from the Vendor in connection with "Purchase and Supply of Mulch 
- Annual" (the "Purchase"); and, 

WHEREAS, the County issued Solicitation No. B200323BJB on August 25, 2020 (the 
"Solicitation"); and, 

WHEREAS, the County evaluated the responses received and found the Vendor 
qualified to provide the necessary products and services; and, 

WHEREAS, the County posted a Notice of Intended Decision on February 10, 2021; 
and, 

WHEREAS, the Vendor has reviewed the products and services to be supplied 
pursuant to this Agreement and is qualified, willing and able to provide all such 
products and services in accordance with its terms. 

NOW, THEREFORE, the County and the Vendor, in consideration of the mutual 
covenants contained herein, do agree as follows: 

I. PRODUCTS AND SERVICES 

The Vendor agrees to diligently provide all products and services for the 
Purchase, a more specific description of the Project Scope of Services is 
set forth in the Detailed Specifications and Special Conditions Sections of 
B200323BJB, a photo copy of said sections being attached hereto and 
incorporated by reference as Exhibit A. Vendor shall comply strictly with 
all of the terms and conditions of Solicitation No. B200323BJB, as 
modified by its addendum, copies of which are on file with the County's 
Department of Procurement Management and are deemed incorporated 
into this Agreement. 
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II. TERM AND DELIVERY 

A. This Agreement shall commence immediately upon the effective date and 
shall continue through the delivery of the Purchase and the associated 
warranty period as further described in this Agreement on an as needed 
basis for one (1), three (3) year period. Upon mutual written agreement 
of both parties, the parties may renew the Agreement, in whole or in part, 
for a renewal term or terms not to exceed the initial Agreement term of 
three (3) years. The increments of the renewal shall be at the sole 
discretion of the County as deemed in its best interest. The effective date 
shall be the date of the Lee County board of County Commissioners 
awarded the Solicitation to the Vendor. 

B. A purchase order must be issued by the County before commencement of 
any work or purchase of any goods related to this Agreement. 

III. COMPENSATION AND PAYMENT 

A. The County shall pay the Vendor in accordance with the terms and 
conditions of this Agreement for providing all products and services as set 
forth in Exhibit A, and further described in Exhibit B, fee schedule, attached 
hereto and incorporated herein. Said total amount to be all inclusive of 
costs necessary to provide all products and services as outlined in this 
Agreement, and as supported by the Vendor's submittal in response to the 
Solicitation, a copy of which is on file with the County's Department of 
Procurement Management and is deemed incorporated into this Agreement. 

B. Notwithstanding the preceding, Vendor shall not make any deliveries or 
perform any services under this Agreement until receipt of written 
authorization from the County. Vendor acknowledges and agrees that no 
minimum order or amount of product or service is guaranteed under this 
Agreement and County may elect to request no products or services. If the 
County authorizes delivery of products or performance of services, the 
County reserves the right to amend, reduce, or cancel the authorization in 
its sole discretion. 

C. All funds for payment by the County under this Agreement are subject to 
the availability of an annual appropriation for this purpose by the County. 
In the event of non-appropriation of funds by the County for the services 
provided under this Agreement, the County will terminate the contract, 
without termination charge or other liability, on the last day of the then 
current fiscal year or when the appropriation made for the then-current 
year for the services covered by this Agreement is spent, whichever event 
occurs first. If at any time funds are not appropriated for the continuance 
of this Agreement, cancellation shall be accepted by the Vendor on thirty 
(30) days' prior written notice, but failure to give such notice shall be of no 
effect and the County shall not be obligated under this Agreement beyond 
the date of termination. 
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IV. METHOD OF PAYMENT 

A. The County shall pay the Vendor in accordance with the Local Government 
Prompt Payment Act, Section 218. 70, Florida Statutes, upon receipt of the 
Vendor's invoice and written approval of same by the County indicating that 
the products and services have been provided in conformity with this 
Agreement. 

B. The Vendor shall submit an invoice for payment to the County on a monthly 
basis for those specific products and services as described in Exhibit A (and 
the corresponding fees as described in Exhibit B) that were provided during 
that invoicing period. 

C. For partial shipments or deliveries, progress payments shall be paid 
monthly in proportion to the percentage of products and services delivered 
on those specific line items as approved in writing by the County. 

V. ADDITIONAL PURCHASES 

A. No changes to this Agreement or the performance contemplated hereunder 
shall be made unless the same are in writing and signed by both the Vendor 
and the County. 

B. If the County requires the Vendor to perform additional services or provide 
additional product(s) related to this Agreement, then the Vendor shall be 
entitled to additional compensation based on the Fee Schedule as amended 
to the extent necessary to accommodate such additional work or 
product(s). The additional compensation shall be agreed upon before 
commencement of any additional services or provision of additional 
product(s) and shall be incorporated into this Agreement by written 
amendment. The County shall not pay for any additional service, work 
performed or product provided before a written amendment to this 
Agreement. 

Notwithstanding the preceding, in the event additional services are required 
as a result of error, omission or negligence of the Vendor, the Vendor shall 
not be entitled to additional compensation. 

VI. LIABILITY OF VENDOR 

A. The Vendor shall save, defend, indemnify and hold harmless the County 
from and against any and all claims, actions, damages, fees, fines, 
penalties, defense costs, suits or liabilities which may arise out of any act, 
neglect, error, omission or default of the Vendor arising out of or in any 
way connected with the Vendor or subcontractor's performance or failure 
to perform under the terms of this Agreement. 
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B. This section shall survive the termination or expiration of this Agreement. 

VII. VENDOR'S INSURANCE 

A. Vendor shall procure and maintain insurance as specified in Exhibit C, 
Insurance Requirements, attached hereto and made a part of this 
Agreement. 

B. Vendor shall, on a primary basis and at its sole expense, maintain in full 
force and effect, at all times during the life of this Agreement, insurance 
coverage (including endorsements) and limits as described in Exhibit C. 
These requirements, as well as the County's review or acceptance of 
insurance maintained by Vendor, are not intended to and shall not in 
any manner limit or qualify the liabilities or obligations assumed by 
Vendor under this Agreement. Insurance carriers providing coverage 
required herein must be licensed to conduct business in the State of 
Florida and must possess a current A.M. Best's Financial Strength Rating 
of "B or better." No changes are to be made to these specifications 
without prior written specific approval by County Risk Management. To 
the extent multiple insurance coverages and/or County's self-insured 
retention may apply, any and all insurance coverage purchased by 
Vendor and its subcontractors identifying the County as an additional 
named insured shall be primary. 

VIII. RESPONSIBILITIES OF THE VENDOR 

A. The Vendor shall be responsible for the quality and functionality of all 
products supplied and services performed by or at the behest of the Vendor 
under this Agreement. The Vendor shall, without additional compensation, 
correct any errors or deficiencies in its products, or if directed by County, 
supply a comparable replacement product or service. 

B. The Vendor warrants that it has not employed or retained any company or 
person (other than a bona fide employee working solely for the Vendor), to 
solicit or secure this Agreement and that it has not paid or agreed to pay 
any person, company, corporation, individual, or firm other than a bona 
fide employee working solely for the Vendor, any fee, commission, 
percentage, gift, or any other consideration, contingent upon or resulting 
from the award of this Agreement. 

C. The Vendor shall comply with all federal, state, and local laws, regulations 
and ordinances applicable to the work or payment for work thereof, and 
shall not discriminate on the grounds of race, color, religion, sex, or national 
origin in the performance of work under this Agreement. 

D. Vendor specifically acknowledges its obligations to comply with Section 
119.0701, Florida Statutes, with regard to public records, and shall: 
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1) keep and maintain public records that ordinarily and necessarily 
would be required by the County in order to perform the services 
required under this Agreement; 

2) upon request from the County, provide the County with a copy of the 
requested records or allow the records to be inspected or copied 
within a reasonable time at a cost that does not exceed the cost 
provided in Chapter 119, Florida Statutes, or as otherwise provided 
by law; 

3) ensure that public records that are exempt or confidential and 
exempt from public records disclosure requirements are not 
disclosed, except as authorized by law; and 

4) meet all requirements for retaining public records and transfer, at no 
cost to the County, all public records in possession of Vendor upon 
termination of this Agreement and destroy any duplicate public 
records that are exempt or confidential and exempt from public 
records disclosure requirements. All records stored electronically 
must be provided to the County in a format that is compatible with 
the information technology system of the County. 

IF THE VENDOR HAS QUESTIONS REGARDING THE 
APPLICATION OF CHAPTER 119, FLORIDA STATUTES, 
TO THE VENDOR'S DUTY TO PROVIDE PUBLIC 
RECORDS RELATING TO THE CONTRACT, CONTACT 
THE CUSTODIAN OF PUBLIC RECORDS AT 239-533-
2221, 2115 SECOND STREET, FORT MYERS, FL 33901, 
PRRCustodian@leegov.com; 
http:/ /www.leegov.com/ publicrecords. 

E. The Vendor is, and shall be, in the performance of all work, services and 
activities under this Agreement, an independent contractor. Vendor is not 
an employee, agent or servant of the County and shall not represent itself 
as such. All persons engaged in any work or services performed pursuant 
to this Agreement shall at all times, and in all places, be subject to the 
Vendor's sole direction, supervision and control. The Vendor shall exercise 
control over the means and manner in which it and its employees perform 
the work, and in all respects the Vendor's relationship and the relationship 
of its employees to the County shall be that of an independent contractor 
and not as employees of the County. The Vendor shall be solely responsible 
for providing benefits and insurance to its employees. 

F. The Vendor shall comply with the Vendor Background Screening Affidavit 
attached hereto and incorporated herein as Exhibit D. 
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IX. OWNERSHIP OF PRODUCTS 

It is understood and agreed that all products provided under this Agreement 
shall become the property of the County upon acceptance by the County. 

X. TIMELY DELIVERY OF PRODUCTS AND PERFORMANCE OF SERVICES 

A. The Vendor shall ensure that all of its staff, contractors and suppliers 
involved in the production or delivery of the products are fully qualified and 
capable to perform their assigned tasks. 

B. The personnel assigned by the Vendor to perform the services pursuant to 
this Agreement shall comply with the terms set forth in this Agreement. If 
the services provided require use of specific key personnel, the personnel 
shall be agreed to by the County and Vendor. If the Vendor's key personnel 
have been predetermined and approved, through the Solicitation process 
or otherwise, any subsequent change or substitution to the personnel must 
receive the County's written approval before said changes or substitution 
can become effective. 

C. The Vendor specifically agrees that all products shall be delivered within 
the time limits as set forth in this Agreement, subject only to delays caused 
by force majeure, or as otherwise defined herein. "Force majeure" shall be 
deemed to be any unforeseeable and unavoidable cause affecting the 
performance of this Agreement arising from or attributable to acts, events, 
omissions or accidents beyond the control of the parties. 

XI. COMPLIANCE WITH APPLICABLE LAW 

This Agreement shall be governed by the laws of the State of Florida. Vendor 
shall promptly comply with all applicable federal, state, county and municipal 
laws, ordinances, regulations, and rules relating to the services to be 
performed hereunder and in effect at the time of performance. Vendor shall 
conduct no activity or provide any service that is unlawful or offensive. 

XII. TERMINATION 

A. The County shall have the right at any time upon thirty (30) days' written 
notice to the Vendor to terminate this Agreement in whole or in part for 
any reason whatsoever. In the event of such termination, the County shall 
be responsible to Vendor only for fees and compensation earned by the 
Vendor, in accordance with Section III, prior to the effective date of said 
termination. In no event shall the County be responsible for lost profits of 
Vendor or any other elements of breach of contract. 

B. After receipt of a notice of termination, except as otherwise directed, the 
Vendor shall stop work on the date of receipt of the notice of termination 
or other date specified in the notice; place no further orders or sub-
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contracts for materials, services, or facilities except as necessary for 
completion of such portion of the work not terminated; terminate all 
vendors and subcontracts; and settle all outstanding liabilities and claims. 

XIII. DISPUTE RESOLUTION 

A. In the event of a dispute or claim arising out of this Agreement, the parties 
agree first to try in good faith to settle the dispute by direct discussion. If 
this is unsuccessful, the parties may enter into mediation in Lee County, 
Florida, with the parties sharing equally in the cost of such mediation. 

B. In the event mediation, if attempted, is unsuccessful in resolving a dispute, 
the parties may proceed to litigation as set forth below. 

C. Any dispute, action or proceeding arising out of or related to this Agreement 
will be exclusively commenced in the state courts of Lee County, Florida, or 
where proper subject matter jurisdiction exists, in the United States District 
Court for the Middle District of Florida. Each party irrevocably submits and 
waives any objections to the exclusive personal jurisdiction and venue of 
such courts, including any objection based on forum non conveniens. 

D. This Agreement and the rights and obligations of the parties shall be 
governed by the laws of the State of Florida without regard to its conflict of 
laws principles. 

E. Unless otherwise agreed in writing, the Vendor shall be required to continue 
all obligations under this Agreement during the pendency of a claim or 
dispute including, but not limited to, actual periods of mediation or judicial 
proceedings. 

XIV. VENDOR WARRANTY 

A. All products provided under this Agreement shall be new (unless specifically 
identified otherwise in Exhibit B) and of the most suitable grade for the 
purpose intended. 

B. If any product delivered does not meet performance representations or 
other quality assurance representations as published by manufacturers, 
producers or distributors of the products or the specifications listed in this 
Agreement, the Vendor shall pick up the product from the County at no 
expense to the County. The County reserves the right to reject any or all 
materials if, in its judgment, the item reflects unsatisfactory workmanship 
or manufacturing or shipping damage. In such case, the Vendor shall 
refund to the County any money which has been paid for same. 
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XV. MISCELLANEOUS 

A. This Agreement constitutes the sole and complete understanding between 
the parties and supersedes all other contracts between them, whether oral 
or written, with respect to the subject matter. No amendment, change or 
addendum to this Agreement is enforceable unless agreed to in writing by 
both parties and incorporated into this Agreement. 

B. The provisions of this Agreement shall inure to the benefit of and be binding 
upon the respective successors and assignees of the parties hereto. A party 
to this Agreement shall not sell, transfer, assign, license, franchise, 
restructure, alter, or change its corporate structure or otherwise part with 
possession or mortgage, charge or encumber any right or obligation under 
this Agreement without the proposed assignee and/or party restructuring, 
altering or changing its corporate structure agreeing in writing with the 
non-assigning party to observe and perform the terms, conditions and 
restrictions on the part of the assigning party to this Agreement, whether 
express or implied, as if the proposed assignee and/or party restructuring, 
altering or changing its corporate structure was an original contracting 
party to this Agreement. Notwithstanding the foregoing provision, the 
Vendor may assign its rights if given written authorization by the County 
and claims for the money due or to become due to the Vendor from the 
County under this Agreement may be assigned to a financial institution or 
to a trustee in bankruptcy without such approval from the County. Notice 
of any such transfer or assignment due to bankruptcy shall be promptly 
given to the County. 

C. The exercise by either party of any rights or remedies provided herein shall 
not constitute a waiver of any other rights or remedies available under this 
Agreement or any applicable law. 

D. The failure of the County to enforce one or more of the provisions of the 
Agreement shall not be construed to be and shall not be a waiver of any 
such provision or provisions or of its right thereafter to enforce each and 
every such provision. 

E. The parties covenant and agree that each is duly authorized to enter into 
and perform this Agreement and those executing this Agreement have all 
requisite power and authority to bind the parties. 

F. Neither the County's review, approval or acceptance of, nor payment for, 
the products and services required under this Agreement shall be construed 
to operate as a waiver of any rights under this Agreement or of any cause 
of action arising out of the performance of this Agreement. 

G. If the Vendor is comprised of more than one legal entity, each entity shall 
be jointly and severally liable hereunder. 
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H. When any period of time is referred to by days herein, it shall be computed 
to exclude the first day and include the last day of such period. When the 
period of time is fewer than three (3) days, it shall mean business days as 
defined by Lee County. If the period of time is greater than three (3) days, 
then it shall mean calendar days. For any period of time greater than seven 
(7) days, where the deadline falls on a Saturday, Sunday, or Lee County 
recognized holiday, the deadline will then fall to the next Monday or non­
Lee County recognized holiday 

I. Any notices of default or termination shall be sufficient if sent by the parties 
via United States certified mail, postage paid, or via a nationally recognized 
delivery service, to the addresses listed below: 

Vendor's Representative: County's Representatives: 

Name: 

Title: 

Address: 

Telephone: 

Facsimile: 

E-mail: 

Glenn Davis Names: Roger Desjarlais Mary Tucker 

Director of 
Chief Financial Officer Titles: County Manager Procurement 

Management 
4353 Michigan Link Address: P.O. Box 398 

Fort Myers, FL 33916 Fort Myers, FL 33902 

239-334-7272 Telephone: 239-533-2221 239-533-8881 

239-334-4602 Facsimile: 239-485-2262 239-485-8383 
custornerservi ce ~cilthe rn ul ch E-Mail: soilco.corn rdesjarlais@leegov.com mtucker@leegov.com 

J. Any change in the County's or the Vendor's Representative will be promptly 
communicated by the party making the change. 

K. Paragraph headings are for the convenience of the parties and for reference 
purposes only and shall be given no legal effect. 

L. In the event of conflicts or inconsistencies, the documents shall be given 
precedence in the following order: 

1. Agreement 
2. County's Purchase Order 
3. Solicitation 
4. Vendor's Submittal in Response to the Solicitation 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties have executed this Agreement as of the date 
last below written. 
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TO 
LEE 

Solicitation No. B200323BJB 

FORESTRY RESOURCES, LLC 

Signed By: ~ 

Print Name:~✓~ 
Title : __ __,C--..f ---=V'--------

Date: -~~-------\x ............... \ -7..-\ ___ _ 

LEE COUNTY 
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EXHIBIT A 

SCOPE OF \YORK . .\... "<Tl SPECIFIC\ TIO:'.\"S 

1. GE:'\TR.\L SCOPE OF \YORK 

L 1 The Lee County Bo,:ud ,::.f County Comrni,,•,iouers seeb tc, contiact -.•,ith a qualified\' e1.1dot" to p,1rd111,e various 
type•; of omkh. pine ., tra'.v. decc-mtive shelL etc. f,x diffen~n1 t;,pes oflaudscaplllg. thronghont the Coumy. ,man 
"n~-needect·· basi,. 

1. 2 The Ccunty shrtl! be eligible fbr anr additional disc0u11is. specials. ::11:icVo, promotiom offered by th.e Vendor 
duirug ib.e tetm of the coutmc1 ,h..:--uld those discouui,. ,,pecinL. 11Uci'or promotions offer a lower cost to the 
County. 

1.J Yendoi- ,,lull pro·,·ide for bag',, bt1lk. bk•,,;n iu, both del.n-ered and p,cl:e·d up by County peiso1111eL for the ,teim 
;,peci.fied ou the Bid Pwp0sal fonn i1lduded 111 this solicitation. 

1.4 Pricing strnH 111clt,de de1i1."ery (F.CLB.) to any and all focatiom witb.io. the C01.mty "" di.rect.ed: 

1.5 The Vendor Ghail provid~ ;,·an01v.. t;,,-,e, of mulch !ic.ted belo·,v by \1,
0.1y of bag:. bu!k. or blown it:. 

• Blovm in ,en·ice shal.1 cou,,i,1 of the Veudc,: im,talli.ng the mu!ch t:Hl:ziug a ho,;e atrnched to a blov,er 
tmd:. 

2 1 All mulch ';hall be fairly unifonn i11 it,; .,,ize. quality ,iml o,·emll appearance. 

l 2 All mulch ,,hall be free ofmi.1terial 1111un,;:itcs to plant grov,ih. 

2..1- All mulct d1all be free of weeds. m\·asive plant p;ui•, •Z·l ,eed.s. aud oth<:'101ga11.ic or 111cwg;m.ic 1Jillte1ial. 

2.4 Sawdmt. gm-,,; 01ippu1g',. excess1n gieen lea,;·es. tbomy pla11i. pa1t,. rncb, s>Jil. dut. food ',c-1~11,'-'- gias\. plashc, 
metal. other garbage or d.ebns mixed. m the mulch i.~ r::ot acceptable. 

3. FLORl :\ffLCH 

3 .. 1 Flori ~.folch •:.b ... 1l1 comply with the follow111g •,;pecificatiom: 

3.1 1 Flori ).folch c.b1l1 be m,1d.e enttrely from the abo..-e g:ronud p,),itcu '.vood and bark of the ~-,fehleuoa 
Quu:1qt:euen-ia tree. 

3.1.1 Flori },folch ,:;ha!l uct cc,utai.J.1 more tb.w i 0-0 o (by volnme:1 barl: ,md ,hrtll not e011tain ro•Jt$ 01 roc-t p1o?:ces. 

3.1 3 Flori ~,fold: , .. hce,:1'; aud chip·; ,;J1rtll u,:,; be iar.gc1: than,;· chamete, JJ.J.d 1-L·2 .. in length. 

_;_ 1 .i Flori ).fold:_ prior tc c!eli,:ery. sh~ll ha,.·e been i.mpected and oe1tified by tl::.e F,ond,1 Deparmll"nt of 
Ag:n-:ult11re ;u1d C.:-m\\mer s .. 1·,iceo. Din,,ion ,:,f Plant Iadw;try. a•; free of Bc:rron·iug Xo?:111.1.teocles. 

3.1. 5 Flori ~vfulch. ot the tiu1:e -2,f de!ii:<:'1:(. ,hnll !:.ave prnc,f of au impe,r.iou and a cemficmiou beru.iug the official 
State ofFlixida 1t~n:ip. 

B20{fJ2.\BJB-Pt:RCHASEA~ SUPPLY OF :\Il'LCH . ..\.:',-.,..TAI. 
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'.!i·;;.:..;,,,.'. 

4. "\TI.-\MtLCH 

4.1 Vita ~vfu!ch shall comply with the fo.Hov;i11g ';pecific3niom: 

4.1. l Vita ;\foich d.iall be pro1.sided from horticulhtral lriud cleruiug comt'Jimg of·,rnod fiber. ,oil. ,,;mcl. htmu,-;. 
a11cl org.;u:uc nunernls in order to e11ba11ce bas.e ,oil comlihom. 

4.1 2 Vita ;\fukh shall be cmi:pletely free of a11y Cy11fess mukh. 

• Note: Lee County Aclu:iinistrnti·,e Code 11-1 l Roadw~y Landscaping Pol.icy (item 15) prohibits the 
me ofCypre,,, tfolch. 

:-. SPI:CL-\.LTI' RED .-\..'\"D GOLD ?\Il'LCH 

5.1 Red tfokh rmd Gc,!d Mukh ~hall comply wiih the fc,Uowi.ng spe-:ificatims: 

5.1. l Red ancl Gokl MukinlrnU be m.1de eutireiy from 100°:c p,ue pine log 

5.1 ·~ Red aucl Gold Mukh shali he color enlrnnced with 3 nc,:1toxic. biodegradable ptgmem. Its ionized colonmi 
,.,hall adhere (,o ilie ,,vc,od fil.'E'r. resi',,ing bleediug. ;rai.t:ing and then ,o,:bng together to stay in place and act 
as a natural •,,;eecl br11neL 

6. PRO HT :\ffLC H 

6.1 Pro EUC 1vfokh ,:hall con:q:,ly with the following specirlcahom: 

6.1 l Pm HT :Mukh ,hall L"'E" made from prernit:m shredded natural \VO,>d fibers: ir.dnd.111g pi.t1e. oak and 
melaleurn. 

6.1 ' Pi,:> Et:C 1'fakh 5h,11l not Mme from con1111en:ia! b£ging and b.a:Teshng imd must be derived exclusively 
fro!ll recycling, •;nch Ji, L,nd de,1lm;g. - - - - · 

6.1.3 Pro EtT Mukh ,hall be color enlmncecl with a nontoxic. bioclegrnd..1ble 1-,'<igment. 

6.1.4 Pro El.TC Mukh ,hall be focle resi,,tilllt for long h,tii'lg appeal. 

BRO\Y:-i ~fl"LCH 

7.1 Bw-.vu ~·,fol.ch ,,h,ul rnmp!y ·,vitil the followiug c,pectfir.;ibous: 

7.1 l Brnwu ~folch shall be a premrnm mulch. mam1fi:lct11red exch,siYely from a nattin,1 woc•d fiber. 

7.1 2 Br•\Vll ~..fulch ;,h..1ll 11-ot contain re,;:,:,us.tituted cli.t11e:1,ion,.1l or pres',nre treated tumhet. 

7.1 3 BfO',Vll \.fukh skull be a :lillll\c 3-1 -'2 .. slu:ed.d.ed \,;oc,d and free frcm any coatami.t1atioa. 

'. 1.4 Brown \fukh Db.all be haiYest.ed from local :South Flori,:b :,ources. 

'· l. 5 Br..::-wn Mulch shall be m.mt1factured through a "(ure•;." prnce':,S and prohibit', seed gem:ri.natio11 of Viee,ts, 311.d 
in1.'3sffe phmt. species, 

7. L 6 B1,;:,,\v11 Mulch 1hall be a mrnimum of four pouni:b of pure envmx,meutruly ~afe pigment ( dry 1.veighf) a11d is 
incctt-p0rnte,d into each rnbic y\ud of mulch 

".1 : B1-..:,•,v11 \folch shall ha1:e an ionized colorant of .. Cccon Brnwu". 

B20-0JHBJB - Pl.iRCHASE A~'D SVPPLY OF )H'LCH - AN::-.t: . .\L 
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',Tf' ~.),,.;· .· 

S. E\{:,I:\"EERED '\YOOD FIBER 

8 1 Engmeered \Vood Fiber (E\Vf) is designed r'or playgroi:nd areas to pro,:1de proper impact atteuu.ation and 
wh,eekha:ir acce%ibte s11tfacmg. The Vendor shaH adhere to the foHoiving A .. merican Standard Test ~vfethocl 
(ASTM) [nt,ernational Standarcb ;:md ,hall provide lab0rnto1y te.sting and a Ceitifirnt.e of Authenhcity anct>err 
compliance lettern to County ,,taffnpon reqw:'.t: 

8.1. l ASTh-1 F1292-1S i Sta11cl1rd Specification for Impact Attemiatlcn of Si:1faci.ng Matenru, within the U,e 
Zon.e of Playground Equipment - This spe-oit1cation specifies in:ipact attem1at.ion pe1i~Jm1,111ce requi1'eme1:t,, 
t::>r playground ml1l1ces and :,mitKi.eg n1.1terials aud pro-v1de.'; a ni.e;1.m of detemllllillg i.11:ipac, atter:.uatK,n 
pedonlll1nce ming a :e;i metb,.:,d thM s1mufotes the i.t:npacr of ,i child', he;1cl 1,vith the ::,uii;:ice. 

S .1. 2 ASTh-I F 1951-1 + Sw11cb.rd Specificati,~1: for DetemU11at1cn of Ace e',sibi!ity ,;:if Surface Sy,,tern.', C nder and 
.A.r01md Pl,1ygrnuncl Equipui.eut - Ihis specificatt,)n eotablishe', mininmm charncteri,tic·, for those fact.ors that 
,:lete:mu:e acces,;ibtl.i!:y' Tili,, specifaatioa applier; to ;Ill type', of n1.1teriab thm eJJ.1 be med under and around 
playground eqmpment. 

8.1.3 ASThf F::0:1.175-15 'Stancl1rd Specification for Enginecred \Voerd F11:>,er for Use as a Playground Safety 
Smiace Cnder aad A..1ou11d Pfoygri:mnd Equip-meat - This specification coveF, engmeered 1,vood fiber for me 
as a p1ayground G•fety :'.1.uface under and arouml playgr0uud equipment. Tb.is svecificatiou e½rnb!J.she,:; 
m111tmum requirements for the fac:orn d::,11 detemillle pa1tid,e ,,ize_ consi,;tency. purity ability to drnin. and 
heaYy metal (oucenfrations c0t1sidered h;.iz,;i:rdous lo children. 

9. Rt"STIC PD"E B..\R.E: >TGGETS 

91 Rrntic Pi.ne BarkSuggetc, shall rninply with the following ;;pecn'i.rntic-ns: 

9.1 i Rw;tic Puie Bad: Nue:e:et•:; !!hall be comidered medmm iu ;;ize and betwe,eu 1-1 ·T (o .:?"' m ,:;ize ,,,,; th less tha1-: 
100. ofines. -~ 

9. 1.2 Rmtic Pine Earl: 'lb.all be free from debris. noxiom weed,. seed,; and ;;p::res. 

10. PL\"1: STR-\\Y 

10. l Pine %mv ';h.1H corn:ply with the following ;,pectficatiom: 

I 0.1. l Pine Stra'o.v bale ';ize c;hall be u1ut~.:im1. mi!llinum of 30"'L x 15··1,v x 16.Tl. + cubic feet \"olume and co Yer a 
'.':'.i ';q1u11e fet>t area. 

iOJ .2 Pine Strnw ,,hall !h1i·e less d1an 10% ;;olmne ck-bris s1,ch as pine ',tick am! weedc. 

I 0.1.3 Pine Straw ,:;hall be free of nox.iom weeds. ';eed." and spores .such as Sour Apple and 1.ygodium Japo11tcum. 

11. YL-\SHED SHELL 

11. l \:Va,;hed Shell ,hall comply ',v"i,h ,he fc,llowi.ng \[:iecirkations: 

! LL l 1.Vt1$hed SheU ohall be n:it:1..ual 111 it,, forn1 and c omist d loca1 oy,:,te:· .';hell. 

11. 1.2 \V3,hed Shell \hall be 111.ack- ava1fobte rn nvc, sizes: 

• 1'" W 1 l~·• ',tze 

12. CRFSHED SHELL 

12. l Cmshecl Shell ,:;hall cornp!y with the fo-lloYvi.ng ',pec1fica:ion',: 

12.1.1 Cn~,J:ed Shell ,Enll be uaturnl ir, it'; fo:111.:md rnmist of local oy<,te1· sl:ell 

! 2.1.2 Crn.',hed Shell ,;h,,ll be ayai.foble ill ie,s than'~·· in ,,.i.ze. 

BH-O•JBBJB - Pl:RC HASE A:-.'D SUPPLY OF ~Il'LCH - A~~T.U 
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13. BRO";-i RI'i""ER ROCK 

U.l Brown Rivet Roel: (A.K.A - Egg Red:) c!nll comply with the fotfowi.ng ,-p,:>ctficatiom: 

13 i .1 Brown Fj1:er Red: ;hnli be 11:.1tu:_;1.Hy ro,.111d or oval stone with a smooth m,face. 

13 l. 2 Brown Ri·ver Red: ;hnli bi.' made available in t\'.'1) ,1zes: 

1-1. DELI\ 'IRY REQtlRL\IL\TS 
14. l A.11 pwdnct> $hall 1.'.oe deli,;ered 1:,e:wel':a the h0uni of 8:00 ,tm. ancl 4:(}I) p.111. (ea'.item time). Monday throngh 

Fnd...w ,x J:e reqT.iested by ihe County. v;itilll.l three (3) calendar day~ after 1:erh:iL electi-.::,nic. or fa., receipt of an 
c-rd.er p[Jced. by an authoiized. member of the County 

14.1 The Conuty 1e:',e:P:e', the nght to deienniue. by adding or ddeting. actual dell':ery sit.es at it;; ,·bc1etic-u at any 
time tboughont the ,eim of the Ag:reeme1iL 

14.3 The Co,.1111y re,en-es ,he nght to refme delivery tf: 

• The ctefa,ery j,; not within the proper tii.11Eframe: 

• The Veudct ha'; imprc,per equipmeut to ofrfo;,d the ,:J.elii:e1y: 

• Ihe 1/endcr i·~ taking '.lllpf•,:,pet ,,r,fety prernutiom: and 

• The '/ender ha, n1.1lfoi:ctic,,liag equq::-1.nenL 

14.+ The\ ·l':ndc,r' '.i deli\·l':ry d1ive1· shaH pre,~e:ut ,l phc,t•J ID. l,p(·•u d.e!i,:eiy. The I.D. ,h.111 ;;l:i,.:•,\,; that the di-is;er i; J.U 

employee ofeith<:1 ll:e Vendor 01. deh•.-etiug company. A.ll pet·',01.mel ui.1ki.ug deh\0ene•, c,ball ·.,;e;u: the 
approprrnte pe1;;,J11:il prntect:ve eqnipmern (PPE) zer1nired io pe,fonn their dutie,;. All deliverie, a:ie mttjed to 
uic,pection p1ic1 :o accepta.uce by an authonzed me:nbe1 of the County. 

1:iJ 1·tiruamm delivery J.1110n11t.s are F.:$tabli•,hed in the table below. Snrchar.ge:; fo: ordern (:found l1l the optional 
pricing :;ection cf [he Bid Sched\1:e F onn) oh.ill be in place. but cwy for orders plnced by the County that ru-= ler;s 
than the tlllll.1.mum debvery order am.ounts identified. below. 

l 5.2 A pa11fal load ,J.:a!l be defined a; any order placed by the Cc.tmty for an amouut less than the miuiumm delivery 
of procluci, a~ ouHi.ued ui the table bei0w. 

l\finimnm Delinrv of Pl'oduct~ 
l:S 1-,allets or 1 1 60 bCTe;. 

).foh::h Loose Bulk 80 cnbic yard., 
Blow ln Sfulch 30 cubic yards 
Ern;:.ineered \\,'c,o<l Eber (E\VF) 20 cnbic y~rd$ 
Rustic Pme Bark ::-fu£_ge, 100 cubic y;;n;.,, 
PineSrmw 

2(1 cubic yards 
Cni',hed Shell 20 cubic yard$ 

16 .. .\DDITIO::',-.\L PRODlTTS 

16.1 The C01111ty 1e~e:p:e,; ibe nght to add ,x delete. at any lime. ruJ.d or atl material. tMk, 011e:,;ices associated with 
thi,, Agreement and iu the ui..1.n11er that i> in the bl':r,t iutere,;t of the Coullty. 

End of Scope of '1'.' ork a11d Spectficaiiom Section 

B200J2,<BJB- Pt:RCH.-\SE .-\::','D SUPPLY OF ~ll1LCH - ,.\.::,,."::',1,;AI. 
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EXHIBIT B 
FEE SCHEDULE 

ANNUAL PURCHASE OF MULCH 
SECT/ON A : MULCH PRODUCTS 

Item Description/Mulch Products 
Price Per Yard Price Per Yard 

Picked Up Delivered 

1 Flori Mulch $ 18.75 $ 21.50 
2 Vita Mulch $ 19.25 $ 22.00 
4 Pro Euc Mulch $ 21.50 $ 24.50 
5 Brown Mulch $ 18.50 $ 21.50 

-····· 

SUB-TOTAL: $ 78.00 $ 89.50 

SECTION c_, ENGINEERED ~'\/000 F!BEf? (EWP) 

item Description 
Price Per Yard Price Per Yard 

Picked Up Delivered 

7 Engineered Wood Fiber (El/VF) $ 24.75 $ 25.76 

SUB-TOTAL: $ 24.76 $ 25.76 

SECTION 0. t,JtED!U!•ii f.'USTlC: P/iv'D BARK NUGGErS 
·············-,·· 

Item Description 
Price Per Yard 

Picked Up 

8 
Medium Rustic Pine Bark Nuggets 1 1/2" • 

No Bid 
2" with less than 10%, Fines 

SUB-TOTAL: $ . 
SECTION€: WASHED SI-JELL 
-····· ·-··-···-·· 

Price Per 
Item Description Cubic Yard 

Picked Up 1/2" 
9 Washed Shell $ 45.00 ----··-

SUB-TOTAL: $ 45.00 
·-···-·--····-·-······ 

SECTION G: BROWN RIVER ROCK 
Price Per 

Item Description Cubic Yard 
Picked Up 1/2" 

10 Brown River Rock 140.00 .... 

SUB-TOTAL: $ 140.00 

Price Per 
Item Description Cubic Yard 

Picked Up 1/2" 
11 Crushed Shell $ 45.00 

SUB-TOTAL: $ 45.00 

SECTION fl. PINE STRAVV 

Item 

12 Pine Straw 

Description 

SUB-TOTAL: 

Price Per Bale 
Picked Up 

$ 4.05 

$ 4.05 

Price Per Yard 
Delivered 

No Bid 

$ . 

Price Per 
Cubic Yard 

Picked Up 1" 
No Bid 

$ . 

Price Per 
Cubic Yard 
Picked Up 1 

$ 195.00 

$ 195.00 

Price Per 
Cubic Yard 

Delivered 1/2" 
$ 50.00 

$ 50.00 

Price Per Bale 
Delivered 

$ 4.60 

$ 4.60 

Cost Per Bag Cost Per Bag 
Picked Up Delivered 

s 1.79 $ 1.99 
$ 1.90 $ 2.05 
$ 2.25 $ 2.50 
s 1.85 $ 1.99 

s 7.79 $ 8.53 

Cost Per Bag Cost Per Bag 
Picked Up Delivered 

s 2.35 $ 2.59 

s 2.35 $ 2.59 

Cost Per Bag Cost Per Bag 
Picked Up Delivered 

$ 3.40 $ 3.65 

s 3.40 $ 3.65 

Price Per Price Per 
Cubic Yard Cubic Yard 

Delivered 1/2" Delivered 1" to 
$ 50.00 No Bid 

$ 50.00 $ . 

Price Per Price Per 
Cubic Yard Cubic Yard 

Delivered 1/2" Delivered 1 
$ 155.00 $ 210.00 

$ 155.00 $ 210.00 

SECTION G.: OPTIONAL. PRICING - (Not included in lrnsfs of awnrd) 
surcharge Fee 

Item Description for Partial 

13 Surcharge for Partial Load $ 

SUB-TOTAL: $ 
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EXHIBIT C 

INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS 

Lee County In-;urauce Requirements 
,, I I I. I I'. I ' .-\ 

?\Iinjmnm In,urnus;e Requirements; Ris/.: .\Jmwg•'n.1e11t i11 110 wn_1· repr·es••nts tlwr r11., 
iurnrm1ce 1'erp-1ir·,•d is 51'/fici•'llf 01· odeq11ate to pn,rect tl1e n'urfon' fnr,?resr c,r 7ifrMffti,'s .. n,., 
followrng ar.' rhe l'.'{J111nNI ndmum111 s tl1e ,-enrh:w 11111 sr 111aintm'11 t-/iro11glrortr tire .dm·ntforr of 
tlds co11,1·nct. n.,., Co11110· 1·e~e1'n'i rlr<' 11gl1r ro -''•'IJIU?H additional doc11111!.'fJtado11 r•ega!'dfog 
i'n s II rr.11 c,' p1·ot'ided 

n. Commus;iml Ci;enerol Liphjlicy - Cove,r,1ge ,,hall app!y to 1--'remise~ anct·or operntion:.;. 
prnduct;; ;:u1cl completed operatiDil';. mdependent C:O:Uffl'lctc1'G. co11tr:.1crr.:1al liability 
exposures 1.vi,h ul.1.1lim.nn1 U.1.nits of: 

S 1. 000. 000 per occunence 
S.:!..000.CKJO ge11e:ral sggregate 
S 1.000.000 pn:du.ct:c:; a.nd completed openHi•o11s 
~ 1.000.(>00 per,oa;il .incl ach·ettising i11;u1--:, 

b. Busines·, Auto LiabilitY - The foHowmg Automobile Iiabitity v;ill be required ao.d 
coYer;ige ,,hl'lll apply r,,::, aH o·v:ned. hifed (11101:011-ow1:ed ,.,eb.ider; nse -_vith u1.i.niunm1 limi.ts 
d: 

S 1.000.01)(1 combmed stngle hmit (C:S-L): 01 

S:500,000 b-:::sdi!y m1u17 per pe:no11 
S 1.(}00.000 boilily i.njmy pet scc-ident 
5500.00D prnpeny dam3ge per accident 

c. ,,·m-ks:r,' ComJ,wnwrjon - Statutory benefits ris defined by FS 440 -eucc-mpa:.,~ing all 
,openitionG contemplated by thi> contrnct or t,g:i:eement to apply tc, ail ov,111er,. officers. and 
employees reg3rdle•:;s c-f the nu111t>e1· of empl::,yeec. \\/orken C::,111pen.sstiou exemptions 
111;iy be accepted -.•,ith '>Vrirten prc,c,f of the State of Flori.dJ.' s ilpprc,vn1 of si.ch exei11ption. 
Employep; hnbrL.ty ,,.vi.ll l.rn-ve mi..n.:imum lirn.it$ cf: 

S500.000 pef accident 
~500.000 dir,esse limit 
S500,000 diset'lse -policy L.mit 

~n1e re1111fred 111r11i11nrrn .lirrtir ofriobrlir1' ,/10,1·n ln a. n11d b. may be pn»fr/ed io rlre J,.nw of 
''E\·ces5 In s11ronc•'" or ·•Com111el'dnl c·111LH'ello Polrci.·s. "111 wldd1 cai,'., rr "Following For111 
E1.1do1•se11i..•1,!t" wr'll be J'•'qnfred 1.JI/ t/1e "£.yc,•si I11rn,•·aut.? p,.;{fr_t'" ,,;>1' ''Co11rnt•'l'cia.l [~111brefla 

Poli,~;-." 
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Yel'ifiprrion of <"on:n1e-ie; 

a. Co,;0e:rnge ~:irnH be in place pri0r to the ccnm1encement of any \1;ork aud thrnughout the duration 
{)f the coutr::ict A ce1t1:firnte of iumrnnce \'.'ill be provided to tile Risk \fa.nager for revie'<Y and 
,1ppr.::ii,·al. Toe c.enill..:-ate sh,,il pr,.)vide for the followi.ug: 

The certificate holder shall nnd i15 follows; 

Lee County Board of Conn~- C.::limnissiont>r5 
P .. O. Box 398 
Fon :\I:i"<'l'S, Tioridn 3390! 

h, "Lee CoiwJ'.', a poWirnl rnbdfrr1io11 n11d Cl1m·te1· Counr,r of rll,• Sr11t.• of .F7iwrda, /rs agerm, 
,
1 mploy1N!_, and pnl>lic t~{fidols '' ~\ill be nnmed a,; nn "Addiriono! In,u,recl" on the C;...,nHal 
Liability policy, inducting Producrs and Compltttd Operations conn,ge, 

S1,1ecin) Regufreme,m; 

~ .. It 1', the re,;pomibihty of the general coutnK·tor io enGrn·e that aH ,ubcont1actor:s compiy,vith t1H 
ui;,m:mce requiren.1eni,:,. 
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EXHIBIT D 

VENDOR BACKGROUND SCREENING AFFIDAVIT 

··' r,: . 

~ \I, ·1 f 'f,' ('.O .. LJ N'[. \/ 
. ~r ._ .~ .. , . · . ,.. . . l 

VENDOR BACKGROUND 
SCREENING AFFIDAVIT 

Florida Statutes Chapter 43 5 governs required background screenings for any employees, 
contractors, subcontractors, or agents of the Vendor who will have contact with any vulnerable 
person, as defined by statute, or who otherwise are required to undergo a Level l or Level 2 
background screening in accordance with Florida law. 

The Vendor is responsible for ensuring that such required background screenings are conducted 
in accordance with Florida Statutes Chapter 435 . Documentation of such completed background 
screenings must be maintained for a period of no less than five (5) years and are subject to audit 
by Lee County at any time during such five (5) year period. 

Under penalty of perjury, I declare that I have read and understand the requirements stated 
above, and that all 1·equired background screenings shall be conducted in accordance with 
this affidavit. I further understand that there may be additional local, state, and federal 
regulations that may require background screening, and that the Vendor will be solely 
responsible for complying with such legal requirements. Furthermore, the Vendor shall 
indemnify and hold Lee County harmless from any and all claims or actions resulting from failure 
to comply with this affidavit. 

Date: 3 -JD ..- /}.aQ.J 

STATEOF ±L 
COUNTY OF Le/!: . 

Sign~ 

Name/Title 
Cfo 

\ 

The foregoing instrument was sworn to (or affirmed) and subscribed before me by means of • physical 
presence or • online notarization, this _,_3_ day of , c-20!)-d , by the above-named person 
and in their stated capacity, and is either now o me or who has produce the following as 
identification: ______________________ _ 

[Stamp/seal required] 
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