
B210268LLP 
Lubricant Products 
Palmdale Oil Company, Inc.~ Amendment No. 2 

SECOND AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR LUBRICANT PRODUCTS 

THIS SECOND AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR LUBRICANT PRODUCTS, is 

made by and between the Lee County Board of County Commissioners, a political subdivision of 

the State of Florida ("County") and Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. ("Vendor"), collectively, the 

"Parties." 

WHEREAS, the Comity entered into an Agreement for the purchase of various lubricant 

products through Solicitation B210268LLP with Vendor on the 29th day of October, 2021 

("Agreement"); and, 

WHEREAS, after the execution of the Agreement, lubricant product number 10.4, 

"AVPRIME-55 Antifreeze/Coolant, Cummins (Trolley, Bus) - Deliver in Drum Container" in 

Category IO-Bulk Antifreeze of the Exhibit B. Fee Schedule was discontinued; and, 

WHEREAS, it would be in the best interest of the County to replace discontinued lubricant 

product number 10.4, "A VPRIME-55 Antifreeze/Coolant, Cummins (Trolley, Bus" with a similar 

product, "Peak Final Charge Pro Series 50/50", which is available from the Vendor at the same 

price; and, 

WHEREAS, the Parties desire to modify the Agreement pursuant to Article XV. 

MISCELLANEOUS of the Agreement to replace lubricant product, "A VPRIME-55 

Antifreeze/Coolant, Cummins (Trolley, Bus)," in Category IO-Bulk Antifreeze of the Exhibit B. 

Fee Schedule of the Agreement with "Peak Final Charge Pro Series 50/50." 

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING AND THE MUTUAL 

COVENANTS CONTAINED HEREIN, IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS: 

1. The Parties agree that the following Exhibit B. Fee Schedule shall supersede the 
entire existing Fee Schedule in Exhibit B of the Agreement: 

LUBRICANT PRODUCTS 
CATEGORY 1: ENGINE OIL 

. . 
· .. . . ·•. . . .. 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 
UNIT OF UNIT 

MEASURE PRICE 

1.1 SAE 30 - Deliver in Plastic Quart Container Quart $3,83 
1.2 SAE 30 Non-Deternent- Deliver in Plastic Container Quart $3.42 
1.3 SAE SW30 - Deliver in Quart Container Quart $3,73 
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1.4 SAE 1 0W30 - Deliver in Quart Container 
1.5 0W20 - Full Synthetic in Quart Container 
1.6 SAE40 - Deliver in Quart Container 
1.7 SAE 15W40 CJ-4 - Deliver in Quart Container 
1.8 SAE 15W40 CJ-4 -Deliver in 5 Gallon Pail Container 
1.9 SAE 15W40 C.T-4 - Deliver in 55 Gallon Drum 
1.1 SAE 15W40 CJ-4-Deliver in BULK 

1.11 SAE 15W40 CK-4 -Deliver in Quart Container 
1.12 SAE 15W40 CK-4 - Deliver in 55 Gallon Container 
1.13 SAE 15W40 CK-4 - Deliver in 5 Gallon Pail 
1.14 SAE 15W40 CK-4 - Deliver in BULK 
1.15 SAE 15W40 CK-4 - Deliver in Drnm Container 
1.16 5W20 Synthetic Blend Mot01· Oil - Deliver in Quart Container 
1.17 5W30 Svnthetic Blend Motor Oil - Deliver in Quart Container 

1.18 
5W30 Synthetic Blend Motor Oil (Ford or Equal) - Deliver in 
Drum Container 

1.19 
5W40 Full Synthetic Blend Motor Oil (Ford or Equal) - Deliver in 
Quart Container 

1.2 5W40 Full Synthetic Blend Motor Oil (Ford or Equal)- Deliver in 
Drum Container 

1.21 20W50 Full Synthetic Motor Oil - Deliver in Quart Container 

1.22 5W20 Full Synthetic - Delivered In Quart Container 

CATEGORY 2: TRANSMISSION FLUID 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

2.1 
Transynd Synthetic or TOTAL FLUIDMA TIC MV - Delive,· in 55 
Gallon Dmm 

2.2 SAE 50 W Synthetic - Deliver in 55 Gallon Dmm 
2.3 80-140 Synthetic - Deliver in 5 Gallon Pail 
2.4 80-140 Synthetic - Deliver in 120 lb. Drnm 
2.5 Mecrnn V - Deliver in Quart Container 
2.6 Mecron LV - Deliver in Quart Container 
2.7 Dexron VI - Deliver in Quart Container 
2.8 Dexron VI - Deliver in Gallon Container 
2.9 Des/Mere - Deliver in Quart Container 
2.1 Mercedes-Benz Genuine ATF FE MB 236.15 

CATEGORY3:GREASE . . 
ITEM DESCRIPTION 

3.1 Synthetic Grease - Deliver in Plastic 14 oz, Plastic Tube 

3,2 Chassis Grease-Pt·emium Lithium EP NL GI 2-Grease - Deliver in 
14 oz. Tube 

3.3 
Chassis Grease-Premium Lithium EP NL GI 2-Grease - Deliver in 
120 lb. Drum 

3.4 
Chassis Grease-Premium Lithium EP NL GI 2-Grease - Deliver in 
400 lb. Drum 

3.5 Premium Calcium Sulfonate Greases (3% moly minimum) 
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Quart $3.73 
Quart $4.84 
Quart $3.92 
Quart $4.31 
Gallon $16.26 
Gallon $15.03 
Gallon $11.57 
Quart $4.31 
Gallon $15.03 
Gallon $16.26 
Gallon $11.57 
Drum $826.65 
Quart $3.73 
Quart $3.73 

Drum $741.58 

Quart No Biel 

Drum $1,283.25 

Quart $5.33 

Quart $4.82 
. 

. 

UNITOF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Gallon $22.98 

Gallon $27.25 
Gallon $34.18 
Gallon $29.77 
Quart $6.27 
Quart $6.27 
Quart $6.27 
Gallon No Bid 
Quart No Bid 
Gallon $31.32 

UNITOF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Tube $6.25 

Pound $3.89 

Pound $3.97 

Pound $3.88 

Tube $4.32 
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CATEGORY 4: IDGH-TEMP GREASE 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

4.1 Chassis Grease - Hi-Temp Lithium NLGI GC/LB Complex Grease 
- Deliver in 120 lb. Drum 

4.2 
Chassis Grease - Hi-Temp Lithium NLGI GC/LB Complex Grease 
- Deliver in 400 lb. Drum 

4.3 Chassis Grease - Hi-Temp Lithium NLGCI GC/LB Complex 
Grease - Deliver in 14 ox. Tube 

CATEGORY 5: GEAR LUBRICANT 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

5.1 Gear Lubricant- SAE 85-140 - Deliver in Quart Container 

5.2 Gear Lubricant - SAE 80-140 Synthetic - Deliver in Quart 
Container 

5.3 Gear Lubricant - SAE 80W90 - Deliver in Quart Container 
5.4 Gear Lubricant - SAE 85-140 - Deliver in 120 lb. Drum 
5.5 Gear Lubricant - SAE 85-140 - Deliver in 55 Gallon D1·um 

5.6 
Gear Lubricant - Synthetic - SAE 75W90 - Deliver in 55 Gallon 
Dt·um 

5.7 
Gear Lubricant - Full/Syn SAE 75W90 Gear Oil - Deliver in 5 
Gallon Pail 

5.8 Gear Lubricant - Full/Syn SAE 75W140 Delivered in 1201b Drum 

5.9 Gear Lubricant - Full/Syn SAE 75W90 Gear Oil, 16 Gallon -
Deliver in 120 lb. Drum 

CATEGORY 6: HYDRAULIC FLUID 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

6.1 Tractor Hydraulic Fluid - Deliver in 5 Gallon Pail 
6.2 Hydraulic Oil - AW-ISO 68 - Deliver in 5 Gallon Pail 
6.3 Hydraulic Oil - AW-ISO 68 - Deliver in 55 Gallon Drum 
6.4 Hydraulic Oil - AW-ISO 32 - Deliver in 55 Gallon Drum 
6.5 Hydraulic Oil - AW-ISO 32 - Deliver in 5 Gallon Pail 
6.6 Hyd1·aulic Oil - AW-ISO 32 Non-Conductive in 5 Gallon Pail 

6.7 
Hydraulic Oil - 10 W (TO-4 lOwt Drive Train Fluid) - Deliver in 5 
Gallon Pail 

6.8 
Universal Tractor Hydraulic Fluid (Dyna trans MP) - Deliver in 5 
Gallon Pail 

CATEGORY 7: TWO-CYCLE ENGINE OIL 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

7.1 Two-Cycle Engine Oil - TC/W3 Quart - Deliver in Quart 
Container 

CATEGORY 8: MO'.fORCRAFT ENGINE OIL 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

8.1 
X0-5W20-QSP, OIL, 5W20, MOTORCRAFT, SAE - Deliver in 
Quarts 

8.2 
X0-5W30-QSP, OIL, 5W30, MOTORCRAFT, SAE - Qeliver in 
Quarts 
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UNIT OF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Pound $4.22 

Pound $4.13 

Tube $4.11 

. 

UNIT OF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Quart $5.35 

Quart No Bid 

Quart $4.95 
Gallon $20.78 
Gallon $18.96 

Gallon $27.16 

Gallon $28.00 

Gallon $28.23 

Gallon $28.23 
. 

UNIT OF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Gallon $11.42 
Gallon $8.92 
Gallon $11.37 
Gallon $11.37 
Gallon $8.92 
Gallon No Bid 

Gallon $16.11 

Gallon $11.42 

. 

UNIT OF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Quart $6.65 

.· 

UNIT OF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Quart No Bid 

Quart No Bid 
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CATEGORY 9; D.tESElL Exa:AUSTJ!'.LUlD · .. .• .. 
. . 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

9.1 Diesel Exhaust Fluid 
9.2 Diesel Exhaust Fluid - 55 Gallon Drnm 

CATEGORY io: nvtKANTJ?F\REEZE .. · .... ' ·.•.·· ·.·•· < • · .. ·,- .. 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

10.l 
CC2826 Anti-freeze, Anti-freeze Coolant, Complete, Pl'emix, 50/50 
mix, Cummins Ene:ines - Deliver in Bulk Tank 

10,2 
Conventional GJ'een 50/50 Pl'ediluted Low Silicate Antifreeze 
Coolant, Gallon Containei·s 

10.3 Rotella Extended Life 50/50 Anti-Fl'eeze or Equal - Delivel' in Bulk 

10.4 Peak Final Chal'ge Pl'o Sel'ies 50/50 

10.5 
Yellow Antifreeze/Coolant, Pl'ediluted, 50/50 mix - Delivel' in 
Gallon Container 

10.6 
Premium Antifreeze/Coolant, Concentrated (Ford or equal) -
Deliver in Gallon Container 

10.7 
Gold Antifreeze/Coolant, Concentl'ated (Fol'd or equal) - Delivel' 
in Gallon Container 

10.8 
Yellow Antifreeze/Coolant, Concentrated (Fol'd OI' equal) - Deliver 
in Gallon Containei· 

10.9 
ACDelco DEX-COOL Antifreeze, Extended Life Coolant (Chevy 
or equal) - Deliver iu Gallon Containel' 

CATEGORY 11: BULK LUBRICANT PRODUCTS .. . <·•:,,• 

ITEM DESCRIPTION 

11.l SAE 5W20 Synthetic Blend - Delivel' in Bulk Tank 
11.2 SAE 5W20 Full Synthetic Delivel'ed in Bulk Tank 
11.3 SAE 5W40 CJ Svnthetic Blend - Delivel' in Bulk Tank 
11.4 SAE 15W40 CK - Deliver in Bulk Tank 
11.5 Hydl'aulic Oil - AW-ISO 68 - Deliver in Bulk Tank 
11.6 Tl'ansynd Synthetic Oil - Delivel' in Bulk 

11.7 
Univel'sal Tractor Hydraulic Fluid (Dynatl'ans MP) - Delivel' in 
Bulk 

11.8 
Mercedes-Benz Low SPAsh Multigl'ade Sel'vice Engine Oils 
/229.52) 

.. , :C:·>.:< ·'· .... · <:i'.:'.<<··· 
UNITOF UNIT 

MEASURE PRICE 
Gallon $2.66 
Gallon $6.24 

.·•····} :•·.••: ·:• •>?:•• 
UNIT OF UNIT 

MEASURE PRICE 

Qual't $3,15 

Gallon $7.92 

Gallon $12,90 

Gallon $12.90 

Gallon $7.92 

Gallon $13.82 

Gallon $20.15 

Gallon $10.42 

Gallon $9.95 
. · 

.•J •. ·.> ..• .··· .. • 

UNIT OF UNIT 
MEASURE PRICE 

Gallon $9,00 
Gallon $12,58 
Gallon $17.52 
Gallou $11.57 
Gallon $8.40 
Gallon $22.98 

Gallon $10,15 

Gallon $15,95 

CATEGORY 12: BLANKETiI'ERCEl~'T OJ.l'F .·. · .. ··:•···•·•·. ·· .. · ·. ·.·.· ><·. J>:.. . 
ITEM DESCRIPTION 

PERCENTAGE OFF 
MSRP 

12.l 
Blanket Pel'centage Off MSRP of All Pl'oducts Pl'ovided by 

0 
Vendol' and Not Seperately Listed Above 

2. The Parties agree that this product replacement will be for the same price and should 
not increase the cost of this Agreement. 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this Second Amendment of the Agreement has been signed and sealed, 
in duplicate, by the respective parties hereto. Each individual signing this Agreement directly and 
expressly warrants that he/she has been given and has received and accepted authority to sign and 

execute the Agreement on behalf of the party for whom it is indicated he/she has signed, and 
further has been expressly given and received and accepted authority to enter into a binding 
agreement on behalf of such party with respect to the matters contained herein and as stated herein. 

DATED _____________ by the Lee County Board of County Commissioners. 

COUNTY: LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BY: ---------------

Director 
behalf 

Mary G. Tucker 
of Procurement Management, on 
of the Board of County 

Commissioners 

APPROVED as to Form for the Reliance of 
Lee County Only 

BY: ---------------
County Attorney's Office 

DATED this I 014' day of J)e,Lf,.Y\f\,V)d , 202~ by Palmdale Oil Company, Inc. 

ATTEST: 

Authorized Signature Printed Name 

Cc:)n~or )1 (A;V)/lrefz-
Authorized Signature Title 

CORPORATE SEAL: 
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