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FIRST AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR  

BOTTLED WATER PURCHASE AND DELIVERY 

 

THIS FIRST AMENDMENT OF THE AGREEMENT FOR BOTTLED WATER PURCHASE 

AND DELIVERY, made and entered into by and between the Lee County Board of County 

Commissioners, a political subdivision of the State of Florida ("County") and BlueTriton Brands, 

Inc. (“Vendor”), collectively, the “Parties.” 

 

 WHEREAS, the County executed an Agreement for the supply and delivery of bottled 

water, water-dispensing equipment, accessories, and servicing, through Solicitation B240103CFC 

with Vendor on the 5th day of April, 2024 (“Agreement”); 

 

WHEREAS, after the execution of the Agreement, it was discovered that it would be in the 

best interest of the County to add an additional unit of measure of ‘Disposable Flat Bottom 

Drinking cups’, item 4.1.7 of the Exhibit B. Fee Schedule of the Agreement, to allow the County 

to purchase a case of 9-ounce cups at a lower price than the current packs offered; and, 

 

WHEREAS, adding this additional unit of measure of 9-ounce cups will result in an overall 

savings to the County when purchasing cups at this quantity; and, 

 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Article XV. MISCELLANEOUS of the Agreement, the County 

and Vendor desire to enter into this First Amendment to modify the Exhibit B. Fee Schedule to 

add the additional product unit of measure for Item 4.1.7 - Disposable Flat Bottom Drinking cups’ 

– 4 to 10 oz. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, IN CONSIDERATION OF THE FOREGOING AND THE MUTUAL 

COVENANTS CONTAINED HEREIN, IT IS AGREED AS FOLLOWS:  

 

1. The Parties agree that the following Fee Schedule shall supersede the existing Fee 

Schedule in Exhibit B of the Agreement:   

 

[Remainder of the page left intentionally blank.] 
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EXHIBIT B 

FEE SCHEDULE 

 

Bottled Water Purchase and Delivery 

Item Description  
Unit of 

Measure   

Unit 

Price  

2.1.1. Spring Water - 5 Gallon Bottle Each $5.69 

2.1.2. Spring Water - 3 Gallon Bottle Each $5.69 

2.1.3. Spring Water - 16.9 oz Bottles Case $5.59 

2.2.1. Purified Water - 5 Gallon Bottle Each $5.39 

2.2.2. 3 Gallon Bottle Each No Bid 

2.2.3. Purified Water - 16.9 oz Bottles   Case $5.39 

2.3.1. Distilled Water - 5 Gallon Bottle  Each $5.69 

3.1.1. Top Loading Water Dispensers Monthly Rental - Hot & Cold Each $2.99 

4.1.1. Tabletop Water Dispenser Monthly Rental - Hot & Cold   Each $28.99 

4.1.2. Hand Pump Dispenser Single Purchase  Each $14.99 

4.1.3. Hand Pump Dispenser Monthly Rental Each No Bid 

4.1.4. Drinking Cup Dispenser - 4 to 10 oz cone or flat bottom cups Each No Bid 

4.1.5. Storage Rack for Bottles Each $39.99 

4.1.6 Disposable Cone Drinking Cups - 4 to 10 oz (max 200 per pack) Pack $3.99 

4.1.7. 
Disposable Flat Bottom Drinking Cups - 4 to 10 oz (max 200 per 

pack) 
Pack $2.99 

4.1.7 Disposable Flat Bottom Drinking Cups - 9 oz Box of 1000 Cups  Case $49.99 

4.1.8. Bottom Loading Water Dispensers Monthly Rental - Hot & Cold Each $6.99 

5.1.1. Bottle Replacement Fee Each No Bid 

5.1.2. Water Dispenser Replacement Fee Each No Bid 

5.1.3. Tabletop Dispenser Replacement Fee Each No Bid 

5.1.4. Hand Pump Dispenser Replacement Fee Each $14.99 

5.1.5. Drinking Cup Dispenser Replacement Fee Each No Bid 

5.1.6. Storage Rack Replacement Fee Each $39.99 
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, this First Amendment of the Agreement has been signed and sealed, 

in duplicate, by the respective parties hereto. Each individual signing this Amendment directly and 
expressly warrants that he/she has been given and has received and accepted authority to sign and 

execute the Amendment on behalf of the party for whom it is indicated he/she has signed, and 
further has been expressly given and received and accepted authority to enter into a binding 

amendment on behalf of such party with respect to the matters contained herein and as stated 
herein. 

DA TED ____ ________ by the Lee County Board of County Commissioners. 

DATED this ?o day of _jVl_A_· _I_C~;f_· _ 

ATTEST: 

~ lf~ L 
(Witness) 

CORPORATE SEAL: 

COUNTY: LEE COUNTY, FLORIDA 

BY: _____ ______ _ 
Mary G. Tucker 

Director of Procurement Management, on 
behalf of the Board of County 
Commissioners 

APPROVED as to Form for the Reliance of 
Lee County Only 

BY: ______________ _ 

County Attorney's Office 

f;c/MtO ;V/Arr·of{} ;7(-
Authorized Signature Printed Name 

Authorized Signature Title 

Page 3 of3 

Docusign Envelope ID: E845F6FE-2B31-48F2-93E4-887E8F309728

3/24/2025 | 4:04 PM EDT


		2025-03-24T13:43:21-0700
	Digitally verifiable PDF exported from www.docusign.com




