il

LEE COUNTY PROCUMENT MANAGEMENT

Category A: Fuel by Transport Delivery

Unleaded Gasoline-E10-Delivered via Transport

Corporation

Gainesville, Inc.

- LEE COUNTY 1lni+ Duvi \Avifina+i Ch +
‘ Project No. & Name: B200480ANB - Fuel Purchase - Annual Primary Tertiary
Closing Date: 8/10/2021 at 2:30PM Secondary
. . . Petroleum Traders Mansfield Oil Co. Of
Colonial Oil Indigo Energy Pro Energy Palmdale

Category B: Fuel by Tank Wagon

Unleaded Gasoline - E-10 - Delivered via Tank Waqon

mew | pescemon | uow | B |y, | TaCost| memee |, |oCost) Smemiee |y, |ToCos Saeiee y, | ToCa| meiee | g, | oMo Smems |y, |Taacot
U luntesded 87 0ctane o | $ 21695|8$00402| $ 22097 | $ 21695 | $0.0618 | $2.2313 | § 2.1695 | $0.0304 | $2.1999 | $ 2.1740 [ $0.0100 | $ 2.1840 | $ 2.1695 | $ 0.0486 | $ 2.2181 | $ 2.1695 | $ 0.0169 | $ 2.1864
Diesel Fuel-Delivered via Transport
L | VltratowDiesel o | $ 21807 |$00523 | $ 22330 | $ 21807 | $0.0733 | $2.2540 | $ 2.1807 | $0.0523 | $2.2330 | $ 2.1789 | $0.0400 | $ 2.2189 | $ 2.1807 | $ 0.0694 | $ 2.2501 | $ 2.1807 | $ 0.0305 | $ 2.2112
; ﬁfe‘s’;ﬁr;;jfsu'f“r o | $ 21795|8$00573 | $ 22368 | $ 21795 | $0.0733 | $2.2528 | $ 2.1795 | $0.0568 | $2.2363 | $ 2.1738 | $0.0400 | $ 2.2138 | $ 2.1795|$ 0.0883 | $ 2.2678 | $ 21795 | $ 0.0352 | $ 2.2147
Category A: Fuel by
Transport Delivery $6.6795 $6.7381 $6.6692 $6.6167 $6.7360 $6.6124

Emergency Delivery Rate

Category E: Optional Item- Optional Bid Category

Base Price Total Cost Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost
ITEM e UOM per Gallon Markup per Gallon per Gallon Markup Per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon
q e 67 Gl Gal $ 21695 | $04025| $ 2.5720 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid|$ 21695 | % 0.7105| $ 28800 | $ 2.1695 |3 0.1496 | $ 2.3191
Diesel Fuel - Delivered via Tank Wagon
L [ VltratowDiesel o $ 2.1807 | $0.4025 | $ 2.5832 NoBid | NoBid| No Bid NoBid| NoBid| NoBid| NoBid| NoBid| NoBid|$ 21807 |$ 0.4642 | $ 2.6449 | $ 2.1807 | $ 0.1678 | $ 2.3485
; ﬁj:d'”a Low Diesel o $ 2.1795|$09525 | $ 3.1320 NoBid | NoBid| No Bid NoBid | NoBid| NoBid| NoBid| NoBid| NoBid|$ 21795|$ 04642 | $ 2.6437 | $ 2.1795|$ 0.1719 | $ 2.3514
Category B: Fuel by Tank
Wason $8.2872 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.1686 $7.0190
CATEGORY C - OPIS-Annual Subscription
Subscription
1 Subscription Each $1,458.00 $1,250.00 No Bid $1,800.00 $1,836.00
Category C: OPIS $3,000.00 $1,458.00 $1,250.00 No Bid $1,800.00 $1,836.00
Category D: Optional Items (Optional Bid Category) Fuel for Pickup by County
Fuel for Pickup by County mobile fuel truck/trailer as needed by County
Base Price Total Cost Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost
SE. L=s oAl il Lo per Gallon Lol per Gallon per Gallon Ll per Gallon | per Gallon sl per Gallon | per Gallon Lolile per Gallon | per Gallon Lol per Gallon | per Gallon S per Gallon
Unleaded Gasoline - E10
No Bid No Bid NoBid| $§ 2.1695| $0.0075| $2.1770 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid|$ 21695|% 0.0181 | $ 2.1876 | $ 2.1695 | $ 0.1063 | $ 2.2758
1 Unleaded 87 Octane Per Gallon
5 ilze::tra Low Diesel S No Bid No Bid NoBid| $ 2.1807 | $0.0075 | $2.1882 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $ 21807 | % 0.0131| $ 2.1938|$ 2.1807 | $ 0.1110 | $ 2.2917
; ﬁi:;"a Low Diesel e o No Bid | No Bid NoBid | $ 2.1795| $0.0075 | $2.1870 NoBid| NoBid| No Bid No Bid | No Bid NoBid | $ 2.1795|$ 0.0031 | $ 21826 | $ 2.1795| $ 0.1197 | $ 2.2992
No Bid $6.5522 No Bid No Bid $6.5640 $6.8667

Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost | Base Price Total Cost
Lon Ll UoM per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon | per Gallon Markup per Gallon
#2 Utra Low Diesel
Dyed-500 Gallons or $ 21795 | $1.0000| $ 3.1795 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid|[$ 21795 | 9% 50069 | § 7.1864 | $ 2.1795| % 0.3600 | $ 2.5395
1 Less Delivered Per Gallon
Category E: Emergency
Delivery Rate $3.1795 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.1864 $2.5395




	B200480ANB Detailed Bid Tab

